CITY of ALBUQUERQUE
TWENTY SIXTH COUNCIL

COUNCIL BILL NO. __ 0-24-41 ENACTMENT NO. D LD l‘)( B%%

SPONSORED BY: Klarissa J. Pena, by request

[Bracketed/Underscored Materiall - New

© 0 N O G A~ W -

10

[Bracketed!Stricethrough-Materiall - Deletion
M N N = ed md el o=l o=
N - O © 00 N & o b

ORDINANCE
AMENDING THE 2024 UNIFORM ADMINISTRATIVE CODE TO ADJUST
CERTAIN FEES, ADD CLARIFYING LANGUAGE REGARDING EXPIRATION
AND RENEWAL OF PLAN REVIEW AND PERMITS, AND MAKE CLERICAL
CORRECTIONS.
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL, THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
ALBUQUERQUE:

SECTION 1. Section 14-1-2 is hereby amended as follows:

“The Uniform Administrative Code is hereby adopted as depicted in Exhibit A,
Uniform Administrative Code 2024 Edition to this Ord. 0-24-41 and shall serve
as the administrative, organizational and enforcement rules and regulations

for the adopted technical codes within the City of Albuquerque, New Mexico.”

SECTION 2. SEVERABILITY. If any section, paragraph, sentence, clause,
word or phrase of this Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid or
unenforceable by any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not
affect the validity of the remaining provisions of this Ordinance. The Council
hereby declares that it would have passed this Ordinance and each section,
paragraph, sentence, clause, word or phrase thereof irrespective of any
provision being declared unconstitutional or otherwise invalid.

SECTION 3. COMPILATION. Section ‘1’ of this Ordinance amends, is
incorporated in, and is to be complied as part of the Revised Ordinances of
Albuquerque, New Mexico, 1994.

SECTION 4. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect January 1,

2025.
XACLASHARE\CL-Staff\_Legislative Staff\legislation\26 Council\O-41final.docx



[+Bracketed/Underscored Material+] - New

-] - Deletion

N
o

- e 3 2 wd el wd el md =l
o 0 ~N & Ok WN = O

W N NN NDMNMNNDNDMNEDN
3%30mm~lmmhw:\>—‘

© O N O G AW N -

PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS 18t DAY OF November . 2024
BY A VOTE OF: 8 FOR 1 AGAINST.

For: Baca, Bassan, Champine, Fiebelkorn, Grout, Pefia, Rogers, Sanchez

Qe

Dan Lewis, President

Against: Lewis

City Council

APPROVED THIS _ { DAY OF JM\—/ , 2024

Bill No. 0-24-41

/)

Timothy M. Keller, Mayor

City of Albuquerque

Nz
Ethan Watson, City Clerk



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E3-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
Albuquerque, New Mexico

- Office of the Mayor
Mayor Timothy M. Keller
INTER-OFFICE MEMORANDUM July 29, 2024
TO: Dan Lewis, President, City Council

FROM: Timothy M. Keller, Mayor 4—

SUBJECT: In accord with the trade permit fee increase approved in the FY25 budget, this
legislation amends the 2024 Uniform Administrative Code of the City of
Albuquerque by Increasing Trade Permit Fees and Reroof Permit Fees. The
legislation also adds clarifying language regarding expiration and renewal of plan
review and permits.

The Planning Department’s Building Safety Division is responsible for construction and irade
(electrical and plumbing/mechanical) plan review, the related permitting, and the resulting code
inspections conducted at construction sites across the City of Albuquerque. Over time, the number
and complexity of plans submitted each year have generally increased but staffing has remained
relatively flat, and fees for basic trade permits have not been adjusted to adequately cover basic
costs of improved services since at least 2009, Meanwhile, over the past two years, the department
initiated and completed a thorough study of its construction permitting and inspection processes
and then implemented the main recommendations from the study, including but not limited to
providing compensatory time, assigning re-reviews to the original reviewer and sending the
corrected plan submittals to the front of the review queue, reorganizing staff and job
classifications, consolidating permitting and inspections on the same floor of Plaza Del Sol with a
shared service desk, providing self-serve kiosks for customers to check-in or schedule
appointments, contracting with a nationally recognized plan review firm, and procuring a new
software system that will replace the minimally functional POSSE software system, allowing
virtual (video) inspections as appropriate, utilizing certified drone pilots and commercial grade
drones for roof and solar inspections and remote-controlled rovers for crawlspace inspections.

These steps have improved the efficiency, but it is undeniable that plan review is a highly skilled
technical task performed by certified experts and at a certain point in the improvement process, it
became obvious that more of these experts are needed for the team to significantly reduce the
turnaround time from the date of application to the date a permit is ready to issue, i.e., if we are
operating at optimal speed but truly want to go twice as fast, then we need twice as many experts.



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

To fund additional staff, the Building Safety Division undertook an analysis of reroof and trade
permit fees in Austin, Texas; El Paso, Texas; and Tucson, Arizona. The Building Safety Division
selected common sample permits and compared those with the other municipalities. In each
instance, even with a 100% increase to fees that have not been adjusted since 2009, the City of
Albuquerque’s fees will still be substantially lower than fees in most comparable municipalities.

Albuquerque Austin El Paso Tucson
Proposed Rates

Residential Reroof $71.40 $333.00 $133.00 | $241.50
Electrical Service Upgrade $137.70 $228.59 $175.41 | $131.00
($4,400 valuation)
Mechanical-Residential Water $78.54 $173.39 $141.51 $131.00
Heater Replacement ($3000
valuation)
Plumbing—Commercial $129.54 $275.42 $244.11 $306.00
Underground Sewer Installation
Permit (320,000 valuation)

For a more detailed explanation of the fee analysis, please see the Municipality Fee Comparison
attachment.

Increasing these outdated fees will directly benefit the public by improving speed and allowing the
Building Safety Division to continue achieving its goals of increased efficiency in permitting
housing and other construction projects while keeping the community safe. This balanced and
modest approach of adjusting only a few basic fees will provide the necessary resources to help
expedite permitting and will not be as onerous on community members and stakeholders as an
across-the-board fee increase would be.

Approved: Approved as to Legal Form:
DocuSigned by:
/ 8/6/2024 | 12:48 PM MDT
Sig/ay | bk
. Samantla S Da Lauren Keefe Date

Chief Administrative Officer City Attorney

Recommended:
{4?'2,""2,4 7/29/2024 | 3:59 PM MDT
Alan Varela Date

Planning Director



Docusign Envelope ID: B290031A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

1.

Cover Analysis
What s it?

On May 20, 2024, City Council approved Resolution C/S R-24-36 which
appropriated funds for operating the City of Albuquerque for Fiscal Year 2025
(FY25). Part of the budget proposal included increases in trade and reroof
permits to support additional staff in the One Stop Shop to directly speed up
delivery of services, more specifically, to fund positions in the Building Safety
Division for plan review support. This proposed legislation increases the fees for
trade and reroof permits, but not building permits. The Building Safety Division
of the Planning Department has no record of increases since for trade or reroof
permit fees since 2009. The modest adjustments reflected in the approved budget
keep Albuquerque’s prices much lower than comparable cities. Additionally, this
proposed legislation clarifies the timing and mechanisms of expiration of plans
and permits.

. What will this piece of legislation do?

This legislation is designed to catch up with the revenue approved in the FY25
budget. As previously approved as new revenue in the FY25 budget, the
proposed legislation increases the trade and reroof permits by 100%. This
increase is a targeted approach that raises only a few of Albuquerque’s outdated
fees. The increase in fees is generally consistent with Bernalillo County and Rio
Rancho, and remains significantly lower than peer cities. This legislation
provides clarifying language regarding expiration and renewal of plan reviews
and permits.

Why is this project needed?
The adoption effectuates the approved fee increases in the FY25 budget.
How much will it cost and what is the funding source?

No additional costs are anticipated with these adoptions.

. Is there a revenue source associated with this contract? If so, what

Ievel of income is projected?

Yes. The Planning Department projects an annual increase of $2,500,000.



Docusign Envelope |ID: B290031A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

6. What will happen if the project is not approved?
The Planning Department would not be in alignment with the fee revenue
approved in the FY25 budget; failure to generate projected revenue from the

increased trade and reroof permits would detrimentally impact the City’s General
Fund budget.

7. 1s this service already provided by another entity?

No.



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2ZAF2B5344

FISCAL IMPACT ANALYSIS

TITLE: AMENDING THE 2024 UNIFORM ADMINISTRATIVE CODE TO ADJUST R: Q:
CERTAIN FEES, ADD CLARIFYING LANGUAGE REGARDING EXPIRATION AND FUND: 110
RENEWAL OF PLAN REVIEW AND PERMITS, AND MAKE CLERICAL

CORRECTIONS
DEPT: 4926000
[x] No measurable fiscal impact is anticipated, i.e., no impact on fund batance over and above existing
appropriations.
[ 1 (If Applicable) The estimated fiscal impact (defined as impact over and above existing appropriaticns) of
this legislation is as follows:
Fiscal Years
2025 2026 2027 Total
Base Salary/Wages -
Fringe Benefits at - - - -
Subtota! Personnel - - - -
Operating Expenses -
Property - -
Indirect Costs - -
Total Expenses 5 - % - 3 - 3 -

[ ] Estimated revenues not affected
[ X ]Estimated revenue impact
Amount of Grant - -
City Cash Match - - - -
City Inkind Match - - -
City IDOH  *15.30 - -
Total Revenue 3 2,500,000 % 2,500,000 % 2,500,000 % 7,500,000
These estimates do nof include any adjustment for inflation.
* Range if not easily quantifiable.

Number of Positions created 0

COMMENTS ON NON-MONETARY IMPACTS TO COMMUNITY/CITY GOVERNMENT:

PREPARED BY: APPROVED:
DocuBigned bys ul d

Dutbie Doubrmsshi 7/29/2024 | 3:29 PM MDT 22‘:'“":/::& 7/29/2024 | 3:59 PM MDY

FISCAL MANAGER (date) BIRECTOR. {aate)

REVIEWED BY:

s Bl (| 7/29/2024 | 4({35‘3:@:%{ 8/5/2024 | 6:3(@@13%“‘8,[5/2024 | 12:38 PM MDT

EXECUTIVE BUDGET ANALYST (date)  BUDGET OFFICER (date) CITY ECONOMIST —{date)




uonenjeA 40Szs (1 bs 00ST - yieq z ‘swooipaq g) JWiad [ENUPISAY UOIIINIISUOD MAN - [T
00'€EZS 5334 [E10) pueID 75°98LS 5334 [E10] pUEID 5334 |E10) pUEJD 0E'61ZS 5324 |£10) pURJD 59°60TS 5934 |£10) PUEID
05785 MalAIY AANEIS|UILpY 00'S1$ sdiey) puUosIad e, 00°L¥S 334 SNIENS|UIUPY 05 €25 394 SANEISILILPY
05'91% (0591 utw 4o %7) 934 & zs's$ 334 ABojouyal { %861 934 pIED Upa) 5% 90ey21ns AJojouyaaL :
T T i 3 - Fonesan [ H 333 ABojouydal % STZS 224 Adojoupar %z
e Rl Srrha“v_wm.‘ . N P21aR03 10U u_u%m_s ap i B 00°8% JRuaM| 00°vS Japanu)
sjaued pg
00°60TS -T SWaisAS JLYOADION - SIIWLA4 JBjOg 00°08TS B2 's|aueq Jej0S BEIYSS (A00b-T07 334 uoiadsu) Jejos 00'08% (sjaued gr) 21e3/04 JejOS o0'0ps (sjaued gT) JMEYOA JBjOS
RS T R s BAREL TR GR v | hbe e ; yEEES 333 uoiaadsuj 16105 40§ UM-1d 00°0v$ [euli-a1d o0'0z$ (Buly-31g
00'STS wawdinby t.-:uEn‘_Hmﬂ_m. K i = 00°0¥S dool Jalew 00028 dool 1313y
o | T il ; b hEREEhtey ptiide i e SR f o
.mm.nanm Asey Ywag |EIUIIF JIMO4 -Cu:_xq.(
> 324 axelu) :
: S ]  ooorts 224 3seq [e2U102)3 00818 (1e05) Bumawsag Jamod Aejixny f L]
{uonienjen 000STS) (MH00E) MWIBd J€|OS |EIIUPISIY - 2311333
e T =
00'TELS 3324 |E10) pURID SIS 533 |E10) puBID 658225 5334 [€10) PUBID OL'LETS 5924 [£10) PUESD SE'B9S 539 [R10) pULID
STTPS MIIASY FANENSUIIPY 00°STS 3347 PUUOsIag 22 2 3 00 LPS 391 SANEISIVIWRY 0SEZS 337 SANCISIUILPY
05°91$ (0591 uiw Jo %) 234 Juip4 jendiq rES 224 ABojouyaa) / %86°T 334 pIe) UPAL) " sy adseynung Adojouypay 3
: Al - : ores 334 Adojoulpal %z SE'TS 333 AJojouyIal %z
R s S .mlfuﬂii..u”‘ P / : 00ovs dooy satapy 00025 dootsmap
B S PRatay / i S R i oo'ors [euty-314 00025 leuis-aig
(sdwe ggp 01 dn) jaued 331a1g
2109313 Apoyy/apesddn pieog [Bued/jRued (231413313
STELS 3y} wouy swayl Suipnpul 00'Lps 0 Juawane|day/Map Jo 3JBS yae3 000t Buissadoud uonedtjddy 33AIag 133 00°8% Jaueg 00°F5 [puegd
i 3 086015 224 uoPAdsu| 2IAIIS AT
PRy T 000TTS 234 a5eg [EN0233 00°00TS @24 uoieanddy aanas Juag3
Acﬁ_una_m\’ 8##%— liwiad uﬁm»m."_: DIIAIRS [eII3|T _m_u:w—u_mwmx_m_u._&—_:—tou - |B3LIB|3
s o= SaCaan
05'TbZS 5334 |EI0) PURID O0'EETS s2aj |E10) puess 5234 |e10) puRID or'1Ls saa4 |B10] PUBID 0£'SES saaj |ejo) puein
00°SLS 1USpIsaY - Mainay Hes Juiping €975 333 AHOIOUYIZL [ %86 [ #23 PI€D 1IPRID v
05°91S (05°9T unu so 1) 393 Sug jenig fro e S or1s #94 Adojouyal 7 J00Y-3Y [ENUAPISAY 0£0s 333 ABojouya) % J00K-2Y |ENUIPISIY
e St IR O o ol oosts , ) aliey) puuosiag 00'0ES 234 UOHERSILILIPY JOOY-3Y [E1U3PISAY 00°5TS 224 UoNEsIUIWPY JOOY-3Y [ERUIPISAY
~ (uonenjea 000E$)
uoneniep Jo %s uopsadsuj
00°0STS uonesaly I |2aa1 - [enuapisay 00°81L% wwiag fuyooy 00'EEES 1U3Wade|day JOOY [CNUIPISYY 00°0v$ 233 uonaadsuj Jooy-ay [EUBPISAY 00°0Z$ 224 uonzadsu| jooy-ay [ENUIPISAY
(4 bs 00Sz) |enuapisay - sjo0y-ay
T 3 3 = 2 l 5 FA R A PR Y (t00'05$ :Sﬁ
i o BeF A R ; " HIB “ Y 2 00°08¥S JIAQ UONEN|BA) JOOH-2Y |BDJIWWOD 00'0¥zS J3AQ UOHEN|BA) JOOY-2Y |eI2AWWO)
{0000S$ uonenie}
{uonenje 000055) 334 /U4 suonesa)y (000'0sS o (000’055 01
000ST'PS UOREJINY T |343] - [EILBWIWOY 2 i K 60'6¥95 40 “yjeday japoway [eIuWWo] 00'00t$ T00'0FS UONEN|BA) f00Y-2Y [RIDIAWWOD 000028 [00°0p$ UOHEN|EA) JOOY-3Y [BIIIBWILICT
LAt 2 R (0000v$ uonenep)
(uonenjea 0000YS) : » - oy 324 1A SUOnEIAY {000°0%S 01 (000'0%$ 01
000TE'ES uoneaY T 3437 - [B3LIWWO) e ; : TL685S 40 “s1eday ‘|apoway [euawwo) 00°0ZES TOO'0ES UoneNn|eA) J00Y-2Y el iawwo) 00°091% LO0'0£S uonen|eA) Jooy-3y |E1IAUWO)
(0000€S uonenjea)
(uonenjea 0o0oEs) < 224 MWIad SUoNEIEY (000°0€S 01 (000°0S ©1
0S'T6¥'TS uonREIINY T |33 - [EIIIWWOD) 20 e 5 £E'0ESS 10 ieday ‘j2poway [edsBWWO] 000rz$ 100°0Z$ UOlEN|EA) JOOY-2Y |ERIBWWO) 00021% T00'0Z$ UONEBN|EA) JOOY-3Y |EIIBWWOD)
IR ¢ 3 : (000073 uonenjep)
(uonenjeA 0000Z$) Ll i Fes TR 224 Jwiag suonesayy (0000z$ 01 (o000z5 01
05'999'T$ uoResRy 1382+ ebawwoy A : 3 f4a: 1 10 sieday ‘REpoway jeuawwe) 00°09T$ T00°0T$ Uohen(en) J00y-3y [ERIAWWo) 00°08% T00'0TS UONEN|EA) J00Y-3Y [ERIaWWO)
(vonenjeaggoots) | 000 = s i 934 1unad suonesaify (0o0'0TS 0 {ooo0Is @
05 THES uoResY T [3A3] - |EILAWIWOY 00°LLS Jwiag Suyooy payia) ZO'VLES 10 “neday ‘lApoway [EAIIWWE) 00°0ZTS T00°5$ UonEn|ep) Jooy-ay |ersRWwWo) 00°09% T00'S% UONEN|BA) JOOYH-IY |EIAWWD]
(uonenies 00055) 0 234 J1WIag suonesy (000's$ (000°s$
00'62¥S uonesay [ [2A21 - [E3LIAWWE) 00'8TIS Hwaad Suyooy 1781747 Jo “sieday ‘apoway |e3uawwo) 00'0015 ©1T05S UONEN|EA) J004-3Y [EPIaWWO) 00'05§ 01 1055 UONEN|BA) JOOY-3Y [ERRWIWO)
[EdiiBUIWIO)) - S}00Y-3Y
234 way) 234 way a4 wayy 234 way a4 way)
v ‘uodsny X1 ‘Osed [3 X1 ‘upisny 9583.0U] %00T pasedoid yum DIV Ajuasin) pay

$L0T 3T YaEW

uosiiedwo) aa4 Ayjedidiunip

PPESEZAVEY L L-LEYE-284+-6398-V1600629 :d| @dojeauz ubisnoog



sduiuado 0z-TT Qs

00°SZ$ SWY| 2104 I T - ilIag pesy apun Jofpue Buieo Bureay s1ng 00'8L$ wasAs Juap sooueiddy 00'vIS wiayshs Juap saoueyddy
2durddy paxij s Bumoljo) | 5 y |
STELS ay) wou) sway Fuipnpur 1wy apel] | i i .a_:o iw:.__nn... 0'vrIS Jay10 sazuelddy

[eatueydaN - 2324
HWIB4 UOIIIISUOD MIN [IUIWHLOD

334 aseq [eAUBYIIP

1934 (€101 pULi) 61519 “$834 |ejo) punap) 5334 €101 PUEID
MIAAIY IAENSHIKUPY B HIeY) PUUCSIad T SRR 1 324 AL
Em.& uiw o %T) 934 dud [2N3iQ ' 234 ABojouyaL / %861 224 PIED WP i

TTIES 5394 |€10) pUrID
53] SANENSIIIPY

STTHS

224 Aojouypal %z

DVAH :weidlosy JnQ ABuey) [eruIpisay i v ¥ 4300 anpeioden]
asjaseg | A g T i o ¢ T o y TR A
[EDURPIPY - SAINYINAS [eQUap|say

3334 |€19) puin

MIAAIY FAeNsjup 334 IENSILPY
(059% Ui 1o %) 224 uig jeudig et 8 : : i
¢ £80% 324 AJ0jouyIN %T
‘€3 553] 10 JAMO uno; < a)i0g | i Ni8 IV Pue sajiog 00'TTS 118 DV pue Jajiog
aseiday/eday|
J131e3H/Jouanipuo) iy 115} Buimoyjo) @ewsn)
Iy wouy swal JuIpnul W4 Ipe 00'vEs 10 Jeay Ayaeld Jo Jie 3250} yoe3 0zT’19% JYAH ‘we.dold inQ aBuey) |enuapisay Jue|g fugeay |enud) saauelddy 00°LS 1uej4 Juneay [enua) sasueljddy
. 334 3seg e e et - -
234 aseq [eAueyAy 75'S01$ [BUBLPIRY - S2INIINNS (ENUIPISIY
ﬁ:o_un..._a\— 0009$) HW.Rg uonejeIsu] waisAs 3|ds [eruapisay - [eIAUBYIBA
s B Stk S < i TR s e
133 |wjo) 2 _ 8934 [Rjog puRI) GEELTS 5 PEBL $39] 910} puRin — LTGES 529 [€301 puein
MIAIY JAnENSUIWPY X adiey) puuosiag i ¥ uam !Eu._uu_z_En( 05ELS 234 IMIRASIUIWPY
(09T uawi 10 %1) 334 Buiji4 (e . 334 ABojouydal / %B6'T 994 p1ed P £L9°9% I r A ireaaed i . ¥ v ¥ kT
i 2 oxto}:_a_.ﬁ 1L0% a3 ABojouydal %z
1521 AindJap 00°sS 3531 Anosap
1BINQ sen 00°s$ 18pnQ seg
uE EoL sway nc_usﬁc_ -_._Eua oum._.— Y JD1BTH JIYEM 5B 0T 19S iaiep weidolq Ing IBuey) |euapIsay eIy ._!m._ﬁ u#u:»..ng:. Iy SR SIUENddy

a4 Iseq
00°0LTS 234 aseg sey I5'S01% |ERURYIAY - SAUINPINIYS [EQUBPISAY

(uonienfen po0ES) NwIBd JUBWAdR|daY J93EaH J181BM _mﬁca!mou - |eIIUBYIDA

1434 (010 PUBIS 0274935 e — 10 |mjogpumin STRIZS R 0. P T 5394 |R10) pUEID ! 3084 |£30) pUEID

MINZY INNENSURIPY 00'STS ST [Buuosiad 3. SNTENSIUWPY i 334 IMENSWILPY
(0591 vtw Jo %) 394 Juid jendia S6TTS 22 AB0jOUYIIL / %BE'T 934 PiEI PR ojo N e T S e T R rond LT SO
s oy 1 . ¥ | 1 7 334 ASajoupal %7 X 334 Aojouypa %2

W] UOW 10 7 - U3 SpeiL ! 81 - s120n0 0S'ETS 81 - siIng

SWRY| 210 10 T - Wwag apes) 00°0Z$ S0 - (eudis g uoNEININWWOD 00015 43410 - [eUBIS R UOHENUNWLIC)
HN3 (eI Map sy Fuimaiioy 000°000°TS | wiepy wiely
Y5 wou swan Jupnppu 1uad oL SUEE9S « Sa.Smm uonenjep ..cE{ ey | 1 y uoisnnu - (eudlis g Uopmy Ly 0001 oSNy - [eudlS § uoHEIUALILIC)

324 UeHRICSU| AAIIS 293

00°00T$ 233 uoneayddy 3awuas 3u133)3

a:o_aus_g ._o~m HIOM |Bd13I33 ¢ :o_«n:_a> xommm Jwsdd Suippng) ﬂm.uu_o?.so._ [ensawwo) - _mu_buu_m

192 |mioL puesp 5 T J ' $eajjejolpueid | pRIYPIS 3934 |®i0L purin

adiey) puuosiag 235 02.0._53:.‘( 0S°€TS 234 3rpensiuwpy

@34 Adojouyaal [ %86'T 324 PIeD WP T TR G ey 10 L AT
; ¥8TS 234 Aojouysa %z
SWRAY| DIGW JD ¢ - jwiag Iped) v uuﬁ.uun._.sx 00'r$ 2v paresadpiyay
00°'sZ$ SWIRY| 0pY 40 ¢ - Juliag apea 00°8% se3ueyddy paxiy 0¥ sadueyddy paxyy

Sw3)| oW 10 T+ 1) Ewsa_avw P3zZUOIOW 00'FS EuEn_:ru vuutn—ns.

05'29% y STL-519pn0

"~ sr-sionno

00'0¥S dooyman 000Z$ doot sy
3 levls-aid 00'0Z$ |euly-a.d
a EE._ sway JuIpnpau 1WA apesy ; i 324 [E211133]3 S2nNAS [eduapisay Rueg 00'%S faued

08'601S @94 uendadsu) awuRs A3

00000S$
SLLETS ©1 000'00T$ UOUEBNIEA ‘U3 [231133]3 00°001$ 304 uonedddy 33puss L33

yPESEZAVEY L 11 9VE-284-6398-V1 600624 Qi 9dojpauz ubisnooq



(uonenjen 000°0ZS) W24 UOKIE||EISU| JOMBS PUNOJSIBPU [EIJBWIWO) - Sulquin|d
00'T£95 5234 |€10) PUBJD 102625 533 |g0L puein vs'avzs s394 .ﬂ-e._._u:-..u — 99'88Z% ] [mol purin _ EEPHIS 533] jm0] puely
STTHS M3IA3Y ANEIISIUILIPY 00'STS ey puvosiad IR ] 233 smensiuwipy | 05'6zs 224 neTsIuwPY
k LS5 334 AJojouyda) / %86'T 324 pIEd 1pas) L N *v ou._!.y.:_m .Go_o::uvk g 1\9 i B K
LT e gz = o N ELT .Go__.::ou R~
U 331135 SR 11SY uE.so__e ks
STELS 312 wouy sway Fuipnjaul JuLiag apesy | - 00'PTS aaaas sem 00'Ls 21025 121EM
00°SZ$ SW3Y| U0 JO T - WA BPR.L RS 00'FTS washs 15ig Jarem 00'Ls WaSAS 1510 JNBM
00°5Z$ SWia| 310y JO T - IR IpRIL ¢ i3 o pdl - 00°0T$ ugd Jamoys 00's$ ued Jamoys
00°SZ$ SWay| JI0pY JO 7 - WIS Ipes] 10D QIND Jam3s 01 asNOH 00825 1amas asnoyfAuppng 00'PTS samag asnoyfBuipjing
00°SZS SWay| 2oy 4o 7 - Nuuaq apes) 9L'ETS IpyeaH Jalep sED 00°01$ 13jeay Jaep sadueddy 00's$ iaeaH Jajem sasueliddy
00001 SWa3| U0 10 7 - WWIBJ BPeIL ZroTs 5-[ 1350p 131EM 00°0vS 5195002 JA1RM SIURIddY 00025 51950)) Jarem souel|ddy
"2 ‘2unixy Jo uiesp Suiquinid
03Ul Ul B35em PaPUI Jajeay
133eMm |EIU1I2]2 JaUalOs J3jem Yun
|esodsip adeqesd "auiyrew uiysem
“1aysemysip Uty [2uap ‘syuey
00°sZS SWiay| 3JOW 1O 7 - WI3d Ipe)| 65°0T% uonesedas ‘sdesy pues 'des) aseain 00°0T$ x0g J3usem sasuenddy 00°s$ xog Jaysep sasueljddy
"3 ‘uleluno) Juxuup 1219
‘feunn (U01235 Jad) NUIS |BDIIWWOT
00'SZ$ SWIaY 240 40 Z - NWwiad apes) Lr'8S “Juis uaynly ‘AioieAe] “Jamoys ‘qniyieg 00°'01% qny saauerddy 00's$ qny saoueyddy
‘e uiuno) JulAuLp 12pIg
“|eunn ‘(uoidas Jad) yuis [ERIAWWOD
00°5Z$ SW1| 40N 40 T - Mwiad apei) Lg% “quIs uayay ‘Asoleae| ‘ramoys ‘gniyleg 00°0T$ $quis saaueyddy 00°5$ Syuig saauenddy
"3 ‘ujeyuno) JuRuLp 12p1q
‘|eunn “(uo3s sad) yuis [BRIIWWOD
00°05% SW2Y| IO 4O Z - Uwdg Ipes) v6'91S “juis uayy ‘Aioreae) ‘;amoys ‘gniyieg 00025 Jamoys saduenddy 00°0TS Jamoys sazuelddy
“€a ‘uiejuno) BupjuLp 19piq
‘jeunin ‘(uonaas 1ad) Juis [RI2JBWWOD
00°0STS W BIOW 10 Z - Msad apes) 805 “juIs U3y ‘AJOIEAR| JBMOYS ‘Gniyleq 00°09% s3u01eAET] 3oUEIddY 00'0ES salio1eAe] 3suelddy
‘3 "aunpay Jo uresp Juiquind
Ol aulj a3seEMm L2IIPU! JA1ERY
J31eM [BILIA[2 “J3UYOS JILBM “HUN
|esodsip afeqesd ‘aunpew Suysem
‘J3YSEMYSIP "HEYI [BIUIP 'DjUE}
SWway uE_a 10 7 - widg apes) uonesedas ‘sde) pues ‘den asealn ._u_._unz._nﬁ ou..m__n_m( Jaysemysig 3uelddy

224 aseg duiqunig

533 jE0) pusiy 5324 |E10L PUBLD 7 seadjeroLpuein |
? adiey) puuosiag TR R e 3 BANENSIUILPY
334 AojouLpaL / %86'T 334 PIe) 11P31) s ey ! 3 B oG

23e3un paeA asenbs
12d swasks uonediu ueauelsaigng i
swaishs mo|ppeg uche
(9x) peay Japuuds B sweidoud ang aBueyd jenuapisay
a4
334 |eQUAPISaY Jo) aseq uonediu) aseg Juiqunig - S2INJINIIS [eRUARISAY

—
§324 |e10] puesn
234 uzanbn_.!zu(

DO'LERS 5333 o pumn | S M % 5924 |EIOL PUBID
MBIATY IANRIISIUIPY adey] [2uuosiag
(0S°9T uiw 4o % 1) 334 Fuiy 334 ABojouyaay .Sam 1324 pIe) P10

Trovs 5334 |BI0) PUBID
mwu m...uw_»m_iﬁwc

834 ._.uo_uE.uu—unN q 324 ABojouydrn .x.u
Jieday Jamas neday 1amag

aunpies
07’195 Jamag :weidoid inQ 28uey) |enuapisay
a3y

aseg duiquinid - SININIS [RRUBPISAY

Y1 Woup sway ucﬁsus u&:um w_._r: X A3 QIN3 J3M3S 01 3SNOH J3mas um:c:_. Suipjing

2a4 aseg Juiquin|g

L EORE
5334 _-5-. B:-._u 90°S0T$ 5834 [E10) pUBID ES'ZSS $224 |€101 pURID
o 334 INBNSIUILPY

009Sk§ 53] [ElOL piNID
STTRS M3IATY BANENSIUILPY

| EEURERTE 534 [B10L PURID.
00'STS adiey) j3uuosiad
234 E.ecﬁn.—... !..wm T34 hnu n__-u._u

% u-s...:..m .632_ P21

a4 Aojouupm %z 15 wmu..,uu_a_._tu.ﬂ

PYEGEZAVEY L L-18YE-284¥-6398-V1 600624 QI @dojaau3 ubisnaog



_ 00’9083 504y |¢l0) puiD [ 583y jeio) purip WS 5234 |e10) puLID LUV9S 5334 [el0g puesD
ST MaIABY SALCNSIUIWIPY 00515 sdey) puuoieg | 2 i 05EL5 334 SARERSIUILIPY
05918 (05°9T s 30 %T) 324 Buitd 121 vvs 333 AJOjoUYIL / %86 T 224 P1ed Hpa1) . T A 9o ; G

s 234 Adojouyar %z

*22 ‘3UN1X1} 40 UIRIP Huiguinid

0| Buj| 2350 LINPUL “JA}EIY

I |EILIIIR JFUBYOS JIEM JUN

jesodsip adeqesd ‘auiyrew Juiysesm

“SBYSEMYSIP "B [EIUIP ‘SYUe]

00'S2S SWAY IO IO 7 - UWIIg Ipei] 65015 uopesedds ‘sdel) pues ‘desy aseun

“ea "ujejuncj Jupupp i2pIQ

“leupun *(uonaas Jad) juis [eRIIWWOD

D0°0SS SWAN O JD Z - WidIdg dpe] ¥6'9TS “JuIs uAYINY "AIIRAR| SIMOYS "qrIIeR

3 24011} 40 utesp uiquinia

0]UI 3UY| 3SEM 1IBIPL SAYeIY

JP1EM [EJNII JAUBYCS J3IEM “Jun

jesodsip afeqesd ‘auiyrew Juiysem

22ueyddy paxig 3sn Suimoljoy "UBYSEMYSIP “HEWPD [BIU3P ‘SYues

STELS Ay woiy swial Fuipnpul Jiag apesy 65015 uonesedas ‘sden pues ‘deny aseasn
00'001S mES_a._cE._un.L_Enm‘_ovE._. . .

00015 13129y sarepm Saduenddy 00'SS Jajeay Jasem sauerjddy

000785 syuis sasueyddy 00°0TS syuig sasuenjddy

00018 101d32J31u] 358340 s3dueyddy 00°SS Joydadsaiuy aseasn saoueddy
uley sooj4 saaueyddy 00°02% utedq) Joojy sadueyddy

2 R

“ma ‘den 352313 uis Juawediuod £ Jof
suoiadsul - NWIRg YieaH JBWnsuo)

quinid - 334 y +
Wuiiag UaRNASUOD MaN eawweY [ il e i

334 aseg Auiquin|g

yYEGEZAVZY L L-1 VE-2847-6398-¥ 1600624 ‘Al 8dojaau3 ufisnoog



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

EXHIBIT A

UNIFORM
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

2024 EDITION

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

BUILDING SAFETY DIVISION



Docusign Envelope ID: B290031A-BEES-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344




Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

EXHIBIT A

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE AMENDMENTS
TO THE NEW MEXICO BUILDING CODE,
AS ADOPTED BY THE CONSTRUCTION INDUSTRIES DIVISION
OF THE STATE OF NEW MEXICO
WITH AN EFFECTIVE DATE OF

[ ]
The 2021 New Mexico Mechanical Code; including Appendixes A, B, C, and D;
The 2021 New Mexico Plumbing Code; including Appendixes A, B, C, D, E, F, |, K, and L;
The 2012 New Mexico Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code;
The 2012 New Mexico Solar Energy Code;
[Fhe]
The 2021 New Mexico Residential Energy Conservation Code;
The 2021 New Mexico Commercial Energy Conservation Code;
The 2021 New Mexico Commercial Building Code including Appendix Chapters C, E, G, H, |, and J as amended,
and all other Appendices as written.
The 2021 New Mexico Residential Building Code including Appendix Chapters AH, AJ, AK, AR, AS, and AQ, as
amended, and all other Appendices as written.
The 2021 New Mexico Earthen Building Materials Code;
The 2021 New Mexico Historic Earthen Building Code;
The 2021 New Mexico Existing Building Code;
The 2015 International Code Council Performance Code for Building and Facilities, including all Appendix
Chapters as published by the International Code Counail;
The 2020 New Mexico Electrical Code;
The 2012 New Mexico Electrical Safety Code;
Errata sheets to the adopted portions of Codes promulgated by the International Code Council, international

Assaciation of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials and National Electrical Code;

ARE AS FOLLOWS:

Title 14, Chapter 5 of the New Mexico Building Code has been deleted and replaced with Chapter 1, on the
following pages. Sections from various other parts of the Technical Codes have been amended, added, or
deleted. These changes are noted on the pages following the Administrative Chapter No. 1.

[2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope |D: B290091A-86E3-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

UNIFORM ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
CHAPTERI
Part |
TITLE, SCOPE AND GENERAL

SECTION 101 -- TITLE, PURPOSE AND SCOPE

101.1. Title These regulations shall be known as the "Uniform Administrative Code of the City of Albuguerque,”
may be cited as such and will be referred to herein as "this Code."

101.2. Purpose The purpose of this Code is to provide for the administration and enforcement of the Technical
Codes adopted by this jurisdiction.

101.3 Scope The provisions of this Chapter shall serve as the administrative, organizational and enforcement
rules and regulations for the Technical Codes which regulate the site preparation and construction, alteration,
moving, demolition, repair, use and occupancy of buildings, structures and building service equipment within this
jurisdiction.

SECTION 102 -- APPLICATION TO EXISTING BUILDINGS AND BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT

102.1 General. Buildings, structures and their building service equipment to which additions, alterations or
repairs are made shall comply with the 2021 New Mexico Existing Building Code.

102.2 Existing Installations. Building service equipment lawfully in existence at the time of the adoption of the
Technical Codes may have their use, maintenance, or repair continued if the use, maintenance, or repair is in
accordance with the original design and no hazard to life, health or property has been created by such building
service equipment,

102.3 Existing Occupancy. Buildings in existence at the time of the adoption of the Building Code may have their
existing use or occupancy continued if such use or occupancy was legal at the time of the adoption of the Building
Code, provided such continued use is not dangerous to life, health, and safety.

A change in the use or occupancy of any existing building or structure shall comply with the provisions of the 2021
New Mexico Existing Building Code.

102.4 Maintenance. Buildings, structures and building service equipment, existing and new, and parts thereof shall
be maintained in a safe and sanitary condition. Devices or safeguards which are required by the Technical Codes
shall be maintained in conformance with the technical code under which installed. Yards that are necessary for
allowable area increases per the Building Code, shall be maintained open and unobstructed. The owner, or the
owner's designated agent, shall be responsibie for the maintenance of buildings, structures, and their building service
equipment, To determine compliance with this section, the Building Official may cause any structure to be re-
inspected.

Building materials, construction trash and other debris shall be kept within the confines of the construction site and
maintained in such a manner that it will not be blown to adjacent properties by the wind.

102.5 Moved Buildings. Buildings, structures, and their building service equipment moved into or within this
jurisdiction shall comply with the provisions of the Technical Codes for new buildings or structures and their building
service equipment.

102.6 Temporary Structures. Temporary structures such as reviewing stands and other miscellaneous structures,
sheds, canopies, or fences used for the protection of the public around and In conjunction with construction work
may be erected by special permit from the Building Official for a limited period of time. Buildings or structures erected
under a special permit need not comply with the type of construction or fire-resistive time periods required by the
Building Code. Temporary buildings or sfructures shall be completely removed upon the expiration of the time limit
stated in the permit.

[2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code '_



Docusign Eavelope |D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

102.7 Historic Buildings. Repairs, alterations, and additions necessary for the preservation, restoration,
rehabilitation or continued use of a building, structure, or its building service shall comply with the 2021 New Mexico
Existing Building Code.

SECTICON 103 -- CONFLICTING PROVISIONS
When conflicting provisions or requirements occur between this Code and any other codes or laws, the most restrictive
shall govern.

Where conflicts occur between the Technical Codes, those provisions providing the greater safety to life shalf govern.
In other conflicts, where sanitation, life safety, or fire safety are not involved, the most restrictive provisions shall
govern.

Exception: Where a conflict occurs between the Building Code and the Mechanical or Plumbing Codes, the Building
Code shall govern. The 2021 International Mechanical Code and 2021 International Plumbing Code, both published
by the International Code Council, may be used as reference documents to help resolve such conflicts.

Where In any specific case different sections within any of the Technical Codes specify different materials, methods of
construction, or other requirements, the most restrictive shall govern. When there is a conflict between a general
requirement and a specific requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable.

When conflicts occur between any specific provision of this Code and any administrative provisions in any Technical
Code which is then applicable within this jurisdiction, those provisions becoming the law last in time shall prevail.

SECTION 104 -- MOBIFICATIONS

Wherever there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of this Code, the Building Official shall
have the authority to grant modifications for individual cases, upon application of the owner or owner’s representative,
provided the Building Official shall first find that special individual reason makes the strict letter of this Code impractical,
the modification is in compliance with the intent and purpose of this Code, and that such modification does not lessen
health, accessibility, life and fire safety, or structural requirements. The details of action granting modifications shall
be recorded and entered in the files of the department of Building Safety.

104.1  Alternative Materials Design and Methods of Construction and Equipment. The provisions of this Code
are not intended to prevent the installation of any material or o prohibit any design or method of construction not
specifically prescribed by this code, provided that any such alternative has been approved. An alternative material,
design or method of construction shall be approved where the Building Official finds that the proposed design is
satisfactory and complies with the intent of the provisions of this Code, and that the material, method or work offered
is, for the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in this Code in quality, strength, effectiveness,
fire resistance, durability and safety.

104.2 Research Reports. Supporting data, where necessary to assist in the approval of materials or assemblies not
specifically provided for in this Code, shall consist of valid research reports from approved sources.

104.3 Tests. Whenever there is insufficient evidence of compliance with the provisions of this Code, or evidence
that a material or method does not conform to the requirements of this Code, or in order to substantiate claims for
alternative materials or methods, the Building Official shall have the authority to require tests as evidence of
compliance to be made at no expense to the jurisdiction. Test methods shall be as specified in this Code or by
other recognized test standards. In the absence of recognized and accepled test methods, the Building Official
shall approve the testing procedures. Tests shall be performed by an approved agency. Reports of such test shall
be retained by the Building Official for the period for retention of public records.

SECTION 105 -- POWERS AND DUTIES OF BUILDING OFFICIAL

105.1 General. The Building Official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce all the provisions of this Code
and the referenced Technical Codes. For such purposes, the Building Official shall have the powers of a law
enforcement officer.

The Building Official shall have the power to render interpretations of this Code and the referenced Technical

-3- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E2-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Codes, and to adopt and enforce rules and regulations supplemental to this Code as may be deemed necessary to
clarify the application of the provisions of this Code. Such interpretations, rules, and regulations shall be in
conformity with the intent and purpose of this Code.

105.2 Deputies. In accordance with prescribed procedures and with the approval of the appaeinting authority, the
Building Official may appoint a Chief Plans Examiner, a Chief Building Inspector, a Chief Electrical Inspector, a
Chief Mechanical Inspector, a Chief Plumbing Inspector, other related technical officers and inspectors, and other
employees as shall be authorized from time to time to carry out the functions of the Building Safety Division.

105.3 Report and Records. The Building Official shall keep a permanent, accurate account of all fees and other
moneys collected and received under this Code, the names of the persons upon whose account the same were
paid, the date, and amount thereof together with the location of the building or premises to which they relate.

105.4 Right of Entry. Whenever necessary to make an inspection to enforce any of the provisions of this Code,
or whenever the Building Official or his authorized representative has reasonable cause to believe that there exists
in any building or upon any premises, any condition which makes such building or premises unsafe as defined in
this Code, the Building Officlal or his authorized representative may enter such building or premises at all
reasonable times to inspect the same or to perform any duty imposed upon the Building Official by this Code;
provided that if such building or premises be occupied, he shall first present proper credentials and demand entry;
and if such building or premises be unoccupied, he shall first make a reasonable effort to locate the owner or other
persons having charge or control of the building or premises and demand entry. If entry is refused, the Building
Official shall proceed to obtain a search warrant by filing a complaint made before the Metropolitan Court or District
Court upon oath or affirmation. The complaint shall:

Set forth the particular building, premises, or portion thereof sought to be inspected.

State that the owner or occupant of the building, premises, or portion thereof, has refused entry.

State that inspection of the building, premises, or portion thereof is necessary to determine whether it

complies with the requirement of this Code.

Set forth the particular provisions of this Code sought to be enforced.

Set forth any other reason necessitating the inspection, including knowledge or belief that a particular

condition exists in the building, premises, or portion thereof which constitutes a violation of this Code.
6. State that the Building Official or his representative is authorized by the City to make the inspection,

Each inspector shall be furnished with an identification card issued by the City of Albuquerque indicating their
authority and must present same to the Metropolitan Court or District Court for the purpose of this section and to
other persons, when requested to do so during the performance of his duty.

"Authorized Representative” shall include the officers named in Section 105.1 and 105.2 of this Code.

No owner or occupant or any other person having charge, care, or controi of any building or premises shall fail or
neglect, after proper demand is made as herein provided, to promptly permit entry therein by the Building Official
or his authorized representative for the purpose of inspection and examination pursuant to this Code. Any person
violating this subsection shall be guilty of a misdemeanor.

105.5 Stop Orders. When work is being done contrary to the provisions of this Code, the Technical Cedes, or
other pertinent laws or ordinances implemented through the enforcement of this Code, the Building Officlal may
order the work stopped by notice in writing served on persons engaged in the doing or causing such work to be
done, and such persons shall forthwith stop such work until authorized by the Building Official to proceed with the
work.

105.6 Occupancy Vicolations. When a building or structure or building service equipment therein requlated by
this Code and the Technical Codes is being used contrary to the provisions of such codes, the Building Official
may order such use discontinued by written notice served on any person causing such use to be continued. Such
person shall discontinue the use within the time prescribed by the Building Official after receipt of such notice to
make the structure, or portion thereof, comply with the requirements of such codes.

105.7 Authority to Disconnect Utilities. The Building Official or the Building Official's authorized representative
shall have the authority to disconnect a utility service or energy supplied to the building, structure, or building
service equipment therein regulated by this Code or the Technical Codes in case of emergency where necessary

-4 [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code §



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or property. The Building Official shall, whenever possible, notify the
serving utility, the owner and occupant of the building, structure, or building service equipment of the decision to
disconnect prior to taking such action, and shall notify such serving utility, owner and occupant of the building,
structure, or building service equipment, in writing, of such disconnection Immediately thereatfter.

105.8 Authority to Condemn Building Service Equipment. When the Building Official ascertains that building
service equipment regulated in the Technical Codes has become hazardous to life, health, property, or becomes
unsanitary, he shall order in writing that such equipment either be removed or restored to a safe or sanitary
condition as appropriate. The written notice itself shall fix a time limit for compliance with such order. Defective
building service equipment shall not be maintained after receiving such notice.

When such equipment or installation is to be disconnected, a written notice of such disconnection and causes
therefore shall be given within 24 hours to the serving utility, the owner and occupant of such building, structure, or
premises.

When any building service equipment is maintained in violation of a notice issued pursuant to the provisions of this
section, the Building Official shall institute any appropriate action to prevent, restrain, correct, or abate the violation.

105.9 Connection after Order to Disconnect. Persons shall not make connections from any energy, fuel or
power supply nor supply energy or fuel to building service equipment which has been disconnected or ordered to
be disconnected by the Building Official or the use of which has been ordered to be discontinued by the Building
Official until the Building Official authorizes the reconnection and use of such equipment.

105.10 Liability. The Building Official, or his authorized representative charged with the enforcement of this Code
and the Technical Codes, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his duties, shall not thereby
render himself personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or property as a result of any approval,
act, or by reason of any act or omission in the discharge of his duties. A suit brought against the Building Official or
employee because of such approval, act, or omission performed by him in the enforcement of any provision of such
codes or other pertinent laws or ordinances implemented through the enforcement of this Code or enforced by the
code enforcement agency shall be defended by this jurisdiction until final termination of such proceedings, and any
judgment resulting there from shall be assumed by this jurisdiction.

This code shall not be construed to relieve from or lessen the responsibility of any person owning, operating, or
controlling a building, structure, or building service equipment therein for damages to persons or property caused
by defects, nor shall the code enforcement agency or its parent jurisdiction be held as assuming any such liability
by reason of the inspections authorized by this Code or any permits or certificates issued under this Code.

105.11 Cooperation of Other Officials and Officers. The Bullding Official may request and shall receive the
assistance and cooperation of other officials of this jurisdiction so far as is required in the discharge of the duties
required by this Code or other pertinent laws or ordinances.

SECTION 106 -- UNSAFE BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES, OR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT

106.1 Inadequate Structure and Egress. Buildings or structures regulated by this Code and the Technica! Codes
which are structurally inadequate, have inadequate egress, constitute a fire hazard or are otherwise dangerous to
human life are for the purpose of this section, unsafe buildings.

106.2 Unsafe Service Equipment. Building service equipment regulated by such codes, which constitute a fire,
electrical, health hazard, unsanitary condition, or is otherwise dangerous to human life, is for the purpose of this
section, unsafe, Any use of buildings, structures or building service equipment constituting a hazard to safety,
health, or public welfare by reason of inadequate maintenance, dilapidation, obsolescence, fire hazard, disaster,
damage, or abandonment is, for the purpose of this section, an unsafe use.

106.3 Attachments to Buildings. Parapet walls, comices, spires, towers, tanks, statuary, and other appendages
or structural members which are supported by, attached to, or a part of a building and which are in detericrated
condition or otherwise unable to sustain the design loads which are specified in the Building Code are hereby
designated as unsafe building appendages.

[2024] [2023] City of Albuquergue Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

106.4 Abatement. Unsafe buildings, structures or appendages and building service equipment are hereby
declared to be public nuisances and shall be abated by repair, rehabilitation, demolition, or removal in accordance
with the procedures set forth in the current adopted editicon of the existing building code or such alternate adopted
by this jurisdiction. As an alternative, the Building Official or other employee or official of this jurisdiction as
designated by the governing body may institute any other appropriate action to prevent, restrain, correct or abate
the violation.

SECTION 107 — APPEALS COMMITTEE

107.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the Building
Official relative to the application and interpretations of the Technical Codes, there shall be and is hereby created
an ad hoc Appeals Committee consisting of five (5) members who are qualified by experience and training to pass
upon matters pertaining to building construction and building service eguipment and who are not employees of the
jurisdiction. The Building Official shall be an ex officio member but shall have no vote upon any matter before the
Appeals Committee. The Appeals Committee shall be appointed by the Mayor with the advice and consent of the
City Council and shall hold office at his pleasure.

The Appeals Committee shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business and shall render all decisions and
findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy to the Building Ofiicial.

107.2 Applications. Application for an appeal shall be made in writing to the Chief Building Official and shall
include a fee of one-hundred dollars ($100.00) made payable to the Building Safety Division, City of Albuguerque.
The application fee will be retained by the City of Albuquerque regardless of the outcome of the appeal. The
applicant shall pay for all tests, calcuiations, samples, and/or supporting information requested by any member of
the Appeals Committee or the Chief Building Official. The applicant shall also pay for the recording fees and
photocopies.

107.3 Qualifications. Both regular and alternate members of the Appeals Committee shall be qualified by education,
fraining and experience to pass upon matters pertaining to building design and construction, including appliances,
equipment, facilities, systems, and conditions.

Alternate members of the Appeals Committee_shall serve in the absence of the principal members and insofar as
possible the alternate member shall be of the same classification as the regular members they replace.

Each member of the Appeals Committee shall have had at least five (5) years of experience in their profession
and be a resident of or have his principal place of business in the City of Albuguergue. The members and alternates
shall have the following classifications: depending on the subject matter that is being appealed, members and
alternates shall have applicable qualifications from the list.

A REGISTERED ARCHITECT in active practice.

A REGISTERED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER whose field of active practice is Mechanical Design.

A REGISTERED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER whose field of active practice is Structural or Civil Design.
A REGISTERED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER whose field of active practice is Electrical Design.

A LICENSED GENERAL CONTRACTOR whose field of active practice is General Building Contracting.

A LICENSED GENERAL CONTRACTOR whose field is Building Contracting specializing in single-family
residences.

A LICENSED MECHANICAL CONTRACTOR whose field is Mechanical Contracting.

A LICENSED ELECTRICAL CONTRACTCR whose field is Electrical Contracting.

A LICENSED PLUMBING CONTRACTOR whose field is Plumbing Contracting.

107.4 Quorum & Decisions. Any combination of three (3) members and alternate members shall constitute a
quorum. A simple majority of the quorum present shall be decisive.

If an application for an appeal is received by the Building Official, any action recommended by the Building Official
shall be stayed until a final decision on the appeal is rendered by the Appeals Committee. The Appeals Commitiee’s
decision may be appealed within 15 days to the City Council; any appealed decision of the Appeals Committee
shall be stayed until a final decision of City Council is rendered.

No member or alternate member of the Appeals Committee shall take part in any appeal or hearing in which he
-G~ [2024] [2823] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code _3



Docusign Envelope I1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

has a personal or financial interest. All meetings of the Appeals Committee shall be open to the public.

107.5 Limitations of Authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of technical
codes or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted. The board shall not have authority
to waive requirements of the technical codes,

Appeals based on State amendments of the adopted model codes shall be submitted to the applicable New Mexico
Construction Industries’ Technical Advisory Council.

SECTION 108 -- VIOLATIONS AND PENALTIES

108.1 Violation of Codes. It shall be unlawfui for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge,
alter, repair, move, improve, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain any building or structure or
building service equipment in the City of Albuquerque, or cause or permit the same to be done, contrary to or in
violation of any of the provisions of this Code and the Technical Codes. A violation of this Code shall be
considered a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof the violation is committed, continued,
or permitted.

108.2 Actions for Violation. The Building Official may, for any violation of this Code and the Technical Codes,
take one or more of the following actions:

Revoke one or all permits issued ta the owner or contractor for the project in violation until the violation is
corrected.

Refuse to issue any more permits to the owner or contractor until the violation is corrected.

Charge double permit fee if work is started without a permit.

Charge are-inspection fee.

Refuse to authorize instailation of gas, electric or water service until the violation is corrected.

Have gas, electric or water service removed until the violation is corrected,

Issue an Ordinance Violation Citation in accordance with the provisions of Section 1-1-98 R.0.A, 1994; or
take any legal action at his disposal.

Assess a Civil Fine.

108.3 Civil Fine.

1. The Building Official may impose a civil fine of $200 for a first failure to cure violations of this article, $300
for a second failure to cure violations of this article and $500 for a third or subsequent failure to cure
violations of this article after notice has been issued pursuant to this Code, Failure to pay the fine, appeal
the fine, or prevail at an administrative hearing challenging the fine shall allow the Building Official to place
a lien upon the subject property or any asset owned by the subject property's owner, The Building Official
may also choose to collect on the fine through any other method allowed by law.

General. Whenever the Building Official imposes a civil fine for violations of this article, the Building Official
shall issue notice of civil fine directed to the owner of the subject property, their agent and/or responsible
party, and, where appropriate, to the occupant of the subject property, as shown on the records of the
Bernalilio County Assessor and the Building Official. The notice of civil fine shall contain:

a. The street address and a legal description sufficient for identification of the premises upon which
the building is located.

A statement that the Building Official has found the subject property to be in violation of this
article.

A concise description of the conditions found to render the subject property dangerous under the
provisions of this Code.

The amount of the fine assessed.

A statement that the fine must be paid in full within 30 days of the date of the notice.

L [2024] [2023] City of Albuguerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID:; B290091A-86E9-4F32-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Instructions for how the fine can be paid; and

A statement advising that any person having any title or legal interest in the subject property may
appeal from the notice of civil fine to the Office of Administrative Hearings, provided the appeal
is made in writing as provided in this Code, and filed with the Office of the Administrative Hearings
within 15 days of service of notice of civil fine, and that failure to timely appeal the notice of civil
fine shall constitute a waiver of the right to appeal.

3. Method of service.

a. Service of the notice of civil fine shall be made upon all persons entitled thereto either personaily
or by mailing a copy of such notice and order by certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt
requested, fo each such person and owner, responsible party or identified agent at their address
as shown on the records of the Bernalillo County Assessor or as known to the Building Official. If
no address of any such person so appears or is known to the Building Official, then a copy of the
notice of civil fine shall be so mailed, addressed to such person, at the address of the building
involved in the proceedings and posted thereon.

The failure of any such person to receive such notice shall not affect the validity of any proceedings
taken under this section. Service by certified mail in the manner herein provided shall be effective
on the date of mailing.

4, Proof of service. Proof of service of the notice of civil fine shall be certified by written affidavit executed by
the person effecting service, declaring the time, date and manner in which service was made. The
declaration, together with any receipt card returned in acknowiedgement of receipt by cerified mail, shall
be affixed to the copy of the notice and order retained by the Building Official.

Appeal. The owner may appeal a civil fine issued pursuant to this Code. The request for appeal and the
hearing shall comply with the procedures outlined in the Independent Office of Hearings Ordinance, ROA
1994, §§ 2-7-8-1 to 2-7-8-9.

CHAPTER 1
PART Il
DEFINITIONS

For the purpose of this Code, certain terms, phrases, words, and their derivatives shall be construed as specified
in this section. Where terms are not defined, they have their ordinarily accepted meanings within the context with
which they are used. Webster's Third New International Dictionary of the English Language Unabridged, Iatest
edition, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings, Words used in the singular include the
plural and the plural the singular. Words used in the masculine gender include the feminine and the feminine the
masculine,

BUILDING DEPARTMENT is the Building Safety Division, Planning Department, and City of Albuguerque.

BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT refers to the plumbing, mechanical, electrical and elevator equipment including
piping, wiring, fixtures and other accessories which provide sanitation, electrical power, heating, ventilation, cocling
refrigeration, firefighting, and transportation facilities for the safe use of the building or structure and its designated
use and occupancy.

MAY, as used in this Code, is permissive for compliance,

OCCUPANCY is the purpose for which a building, or portion thereof, is used, or intended fc be used. The term
"occupancy” as used in this Code shall include the building or portion thereof housing such use.

REPAIR is the patching, restoration, or renewal of materials, elements, equipment, or fixtures for the sole purpose
of maintaining such materials, elements, equipment, or fixtures in sound working condition.

RETAINING WALL is a2 wall that has a difference in finished grade on opposite sides that exceeds 36 inches.
-8- (2024} [2623} City of Albuquergue Uniform Administrative Code [



Docusign Envelope [D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

SHALL, as used in this Code, is mandatory.

TECHNICAL CODES are those codes adopted by this jurisdiction containing the provisions for design,
construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal, demolition, use, location, accupancy, maintenance of buildings,
structures, and building service equipment as herein defined.

VALUATION or VALUE, as applied to a building and its building service equipment, shall be the estimated cost to
replace the building and its building service equipment in kind, based on current replacement costs.

CHAPTER 1
PART Il
PERMITS AND INSPECTIONS

SECTION 108 -- PERMITS

109.1 Permits Required. Except as specified in Section 109.2, no building, structure, or building service
equipment regulated by this Code and the Technical Codes shall be erected, constructed, enlarged, altered,
repaired, moved, improved, removed, converted, or demolished unless a separate, appropriate permit for each
building, structure, or building service equipment has first been obtained from the Building Official. All re-roofs
require a permit and inspection(s).

109.2 Exempted Work. A permit shall not be required for the types of work in each of the separate classes of
permit as listed below. Exemption from the permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in violation of the pravisions of the Technical Codes or any other laws or
ordinances of this jurisdiction.

109.2.1 Building Permits. A building permit will not be required for the following:

1) One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses, and similar uses,

provided the building area does not exceed 120 square feet.

2) Exterior fences and freestanding masonry walls not over six feet high above grade on the lowest side.

3) Oil derricks.

4) Non-fixed and moveable fixtures, cases, racks, counters, and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches high;
Exception: Non-fixed and moveable cases, counters, and partitions, including fences, of any
height, permanently or temporarily installed in an A-2 occupancy shall be approved by the
Albuguerque Fire Department,

Retaining walls, which do not have a difference in finished grade on opposite sides exceeding 36 inches,
unless supporting a surcharge or impounding flammable liquids.

Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5000 galions and the ratio of
height to diameter or width does not exceed two to one.

Platforms, walks, and driveways not more than 30 inches above adjacent grade and not over a story or
basement below and not part of an accessible route.

Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops, and similar finish work.

Temporary motion picture, television, and theater stage sets and scenery.

Window awnings not projecting more than 54 inches that are supported by an exterior wall, and nothing
else, of a building regulated by the International Residential Code.

Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to buildings regulated by the International Residential Code that
are less than 54 inches deep, do not exceed 5000 gallons, and are installed entirely above ground.
Repairs, as defined herein, less than $1000.00 in valuation.

installation or work which is done after regular business hours or during a holiday or when immediate
action is imperative to safeguard life, health, or property, provided such person making the installation or
performing the work applies for a permit covering the installation or work nof later than the next business
day.

Construction, alteration, or repair work for which a permit is not required by law or ordinance.

Tents.
Exception: Tents regulated by Chapter 24 of the International Fire Code shall be approved and

~9- [2024] [2623] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

permitted by the Albuquerque Fire Department.

Interior plastering or paneling of existing surfaces, provided the material meets all applicable requirements
of flame spread required by this Code.

Exterior re-plastering that does not require the application of exterior lath,

Signs. The following signs shall not require a sign permit. These exemptions shall not be construed as
relieving the owner of a sign from the responsibility of its erection and maintenance, and its compliance
with the provisions of this Code or any other law or ordinance regulating the same.

a) The changing of the advertising copy or message on a painted or printed sign only. Except for
theater marquees and similar signs specifically designed for the use of a replaceable copy. Electric
signs shall not be inciuded in this exemption.

b) Painting, repainting, or cleaning of an advertising structure or the changing of the advertising copy
or message thereon shall not be considered an erection or alteration which requires a sign permit
unless a structural change is made.

¢) Signs less than 6 feet above grade.

d) Non-electric signs with an area of 2 square feet or less.

19) Interior non-structural demclitions,

Unless otherwise exempted by this Code, separate plumbing, electrical, and mechanical permits will be required
for the above exempted items.

109.2.2 Plumbing Permits. A plumbing permit will not be required for the following:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, soil, waste or vent pipe, provided, however, that should any concealed
trap, drain pipe, soil, waste or vent pipe become defective and it becomes necessary to remove and
replace the same with new material, the same shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be
procured and inspection made as provided in this Code.

The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves, or fixtures, nor for the removal and
reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do nat involve or require the rearrangement of valves,
pipes, or fixtures.

Work which is done when immediate action is imperative to safeguard life, health, or property, provided
such person performing the work applies for a permit covering the work not later than the next business
day.

The installation of temporary lines for testing equipment or apparatus. No deviation may be made from
the installation described in the permit without the approval of the Building Official.

Replacement of plumbing fixtures with the same type of configuration.

109.2.3 Electrical Permits. An electrical permit will not be required for the following:

1. Portable motors or other portable appliances energized by means of a cord or cable having an attachment
plug end to be connected to an approved receptacle when that cord or cable is permitted by the Electrical
Code.

Repair or replacement of fixed motors, transformers, or fixed listed appliances of the same type and rating
in the same location.

Listed cord-and-plug connected temporary decorative lighting.

Repair or replacement of current-carrying parts of any switch, contactor, or control device.

Repair or replacement of receptacles with receptacles of the same type and configuration.

Repairs to electric signs and outline lighting with replacement parts of the same type and rating.

Removal of slectrical wiring.

Temporary wiring for experimental purposes in suitable experimental laboratories.

A permit shall not be required for the installation, alteration or repair of electrical wiring, apparatus, or
equipment for the generation, transmission, distribution, metering of electrical energy, in the operation of
sighals, or the transmission of intefligence by a public or private utility in the exercise of its function as a
serving utility.

. Work which is done when immaediate action is imperative to safeguard life, health, or property, provided
such person performing the work applies for a permit covering the work not later than the next business
day.

. Installations of communications equipment under the exclusive control of communications utilities located
outdoors or in building spaces used exclusively for such installations.

-10- [2024] [2028] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope |D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

12. Installations under the exclusive control of an electric utility where such installations:
a. Consist of service drops or service laterals, and associated metering, or
b. Are located in legally established easements or rights-of-way designated by or recognized by
public service commissions, utility commissions, or other regulatory agencies having jurisdiction
for such installations.

109.2.4 Mechanical Permits. A mechanical permit will not be required for the following:

Any portable heating appliance.
Any portable ventilating equipment.
Any portable cooling unit.
Any portable evaporative cooler.
Any closed system of steam, hot, or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling equipment
regulated by the Mechanical Code,
Replacement of any component part of assembly of an appliance, which does not alter its original
approval and compiies with other applicable requirements of the Technical Codes.
Any Refrigerating equipment, which is part of the equipment for which a permit has been issued pursuant
to the requirements of the Technical Codes.
Any self-contained refrigerating system as defined in the Mechanical Code.
. The installation of temporary lines for testing equipment or apparatus.

- Work which is done when immediate action is imperative to safeguard life, health, or property, provided
such person performing the work applies for a permit covering the work not later than the next business
day.

SECTION 110 -- APPLICATION FOR PERMIT

110.1 Application. To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application using an approved form
furnished by the Building Safety Division for that purpose. Such application shall:

1. Identify and describe the work to be covered by the permit for which application is made.
Phase work shall be identified at submittal. Each phase will be assigned a separate permit number and
fees will be assessed according to Table 112-A.
Describe the land on which the proposed work is to be done by legal description and street address or
similar description that will readily identify and definitely Jocate the propesed building or work.
Indicate the use and occupancy for which the proposed work is intended.

Be accompanied by plans, diagrams, engineering calculations, computations and specifications and other
data as required in Section 110.2.
State the valuation of any new building, structure, or any addition, remodeling, or alteration to an existing
building.

7. Be signed by the permit holder, or his authorized agent, who may be required to submit evidence to
indicate such authority.

8. Give such other data and information, as may be required by the Building Official.

110.2 Submittal Documents. With each application for a building permit and when required by the Building
Official for enforcement of any provisions of this Code two sets of plans and specifications shall be submitted.

EXCEPTION: The Building Official may waive the submission of plans, calculations, etc., if he finds that the
nature of the work applied for is such that reviewing of plans is not necessary to obtain compliance with this Code.
The Building Official shall require all plans and specifications be prepared and sealed by a Registered Architect
and/or Registered Professional Engineer(s) licensed to practice in the State of New Mexico for all uses as listed in
Chapter 3 of the International Building Code with the exception of:

1. Single-family dwellings not more than two (2) stories in height.
Multiple dwellings not more than two (2) stories in height containing not more than four (4} dwelling units of
wood-frame construction; provided, this paragraph shall not be construed to allow a person whe is not
registered under the Architectural Act to design multiple clusters of up to four (4) dwelling units each to
form apartment or where the total exceeds four (4) dwelling units on any lawfully divided lot.
Garages or other structures not more than two (2) stories in height which are appurtenant to buildings

-11- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope 1D; B290091A-B6EI-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

described in Paragraph 1 and 2 of this subsection;
Non-Residential buildings, or additions, having a total occupant load of ten (10) or less and two stories or
less in height. Does not include E {Educational), H (Hazardous) or | (institutional) occupancies, all of which
must be certified by an architect and/or engineer{s} licensed to practice in the State of New Mexico.

5. Alterations to buildings, or structures, which present no unusual conditions, hazards ar change in
occupancy.

The Building Official shall require the plans to be prepared and sealed by a Registered New Mexico Architect and/or
Registered New Mexico Professional Engineer(s) for any specific construction that involves public safety or heaith
and wherein the public welfare or the safeguarding of life, health or property is concerned, or a change of occupancy
is involved. Occupant load shall be defined and determined by the method set forth in Table 1004.5 of the
International Building Code, as amended by the New Mexico Commercial Building Code.

When required by the Building Official, the responsibility of a licensed Architect and Licensed Engineer(s) shall be
demonstrated on each sheet of the drawings by the appearance of their seal and signature and shall include the
following:

Architect.

Structural Engineer.

Electrical Engineer.

Mechanical Engineer.

Civil Engineer.

Where an additional specific technical consideration is required, it shall also be acknowledged by seal and
signature. The electrical design shall be prepared and sealed by a registered professional engineer,
licensed to practice electrical engineering in the State of New Mexico, when the installation exceeds 400
amperes.

The Mechanical design shall be prepared and sealed by a registered professional engineer, licensed to
practice mechanical engineering in the State of New Mexico, when the total mechanical equipment,
materials, and labor, exceeds $50,000.00 in valuation or if the building exceeds two stories in height, The
Plumbing design shall be prepared and sealed by a registered professional engineer, licensed fo practice
mechanical engineering in the State of New Mexico, when the fixture unit count of the project exceeds the
capacity of one 4" building drain, as specified in Table 717.1 of the Uniform Plumbing Code or if the building
exceeds two stories in height.

110.3 Information on Pians and Specifications. Plans shall be drawn to scale upon substantial paper or submitted
electronically and shali be of sufficient clarity to indicate the nature and extent of the work proposed and show in detail
that it will conform to the provisions of the Technical Codes and all relevant laws, ordinances, rules and regulations.
Information on plans and specifications shall include, but not be limited to, the foliowing: the house and street
address of the work, name and address of the owner, and/or the contractor, and the person preparing the plans,
seismic category, type of construction, area of each floor, occupancy group and occupant load, soil bearing capacity,
concrete strength, lumber and steel stress values, wind, roof, and floor design loads.

Plans shall also include a site plan showing property lines and the location of the proposed building and of every
existing building on the property.

The Building Official may require special calculations regarding three-story wood framed buildings, retaining walls,
or any other data or computations not specifically mentioned herein in order to show the correctness of the plans,

Plans for buildings more than two stories in height of other than buildings regulated by the International Residential
Code shall indicate how required structural and fire-resistive integrity will be maintained where a penetration will be
made for electrical, mechanical, plumbing and communication conduits, pipes and similar systems.

For one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses regulated by the International Residential Code, minimum plan
submittal [is] to include but not be limited to the following drawings: Site plan, Foundation plan, Floor plan, Framing
plan, Braced Wall plan, Mechanical plan, Electrical plan, cross-section through bearing wall, elevations, and
calculations, as required. Plumbing fixtures may be shown on the floor plan. Roof ventilation shall be shown on the
Roof Framing plan. Under floor ventilation shall be shown on the Floor Framing plan.

~12- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code E



Dacusign Envelope |D: B280091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Information and computation on building services equipment shall be indicated in the plans including installation of
consumer plumbing, drainage, gas piping, heating and cooling, ventilating and refrigeration systems. Electrical
plans shall show electrical risers, conductor sizes, grounding, load calculations, disconnects, panel schedules, and
wiring methods.

Any specifications or general expression such as, "work shall be done in accordance with the Albuguerque Codes,”
or, "to the satisfaction of the City Building Official,” shall be deemed inadequate and incomplete.

110.4 Construction Documents Review Procedures; Third-Party Plan Review: In addition to the standard plan
review processes, applicants for building permits shall have the aption of providing for a Third-Party Plans Reviewer
or Third-Party Plans Review Agency , at the applicant's expense, to perform a code compliance review of the
project, including review of one or more components of the construction documents set forth in this section, and to
provide the Building Official with a certified report of the findings of the review, in a format acceptable to the Building
Official. "Components” of construction documents as used in this section shall refer to the various disciplines
requiring review. The Building Official shall accept such reports from approved Third-Party Plans_Reviewers or
Third-Party Plans Review Agencies, provided that the Building Official determines that such agencies and reviewers
satisfy the qualification and reliability requirements established by the Building Official and all such reports are
certified by reviewers who possess a valid license as a registered architect or professional engineer in the State of
New Mexico. If the Building Official is satisfied that the proposed construction documents or certified components
of construction documents conform to the requirements of the Technical Codes, the Uniform Administrative Code
of the City of Albuguerque, and all applicable faws, rules, and regulations, the Building Official shall approve the
construction documents or certified components of the construction documents.

110.4.1 Minimum Qualification, Training, Experience and Reliability Requirements for Approved Third-
Party Plans Reviewers and Third-Party Plans Review Agencies. Third-Party Plans Reviewers or Third-Farty
Plans Review Agencies shall meet the following requirements:

1. Each Third-Party Plans Reviewer who reviews construction documents shall possess the appropriate
licenses and/or certifications and expertise in order to review the type of documents being reviewed and
shall submit evidence annually that his or her license and/or certification is valid.

Each Third-Party Plans Review Agency shall have adequate staff with the appropriate licenses and/or
certifications and expertise to review the types of construction documents that they propose to review. All
approved submitted construction documents shall bear the stamp and signature of the approving reviewer
for the respective discipline.

Each Third-Party Plans Review Agency shall include at least one registered architect or professional
engineer licensed in the State of New Mexico who shall act as the professional in charge of the review and
who shall certify the plan reviews performed by the agency. Any person working for the agency who is not
so licensed shall work under the direct supervision of an architect or professional engineer who holds a
current registration in the State of New Mexico.

Each Plans Reviewer who reviews construction documents under this section, either as a Third-Party Plans
Reviewer or as a member of a Plans Review Agency, shall have an acceptable level of expertise and
experience in the performance of code compliance reviews in the disciplines for which he or she is seeking
certification, which shall include at a minimum: pessession of a current ICC certification as a plans
reviewer, or a certifying agency recognized by ICC, IAPMO or NFPA, in the discipline or disciplines in which
the Reviewer is applying to perform reviews.

Such additional requirements, as the Building Official may impose from time to time, to ensure the

accuracy and reliability of the plans reviewers and the plan reviews conducted.

110.4.2 Approval and Certification of Third-Party Plans Reviewers and Plan Review Agencies. An individual
or agency that wishes to be certified as an approved Third-Party Plans Reviewer or Third-Party Plans Review
Agency shall submit an application on the form provided by the Building Official and shall provide all necessary
information and dacumentation to demonstrate satisfaction of the minimum gualifications, training, experience, and
reliability requirements set forth in Subsection 110.4.1. The Third-Party Plans Reviewer and Third-Party Plans
Review Agency shall amend a pending certification application or a certification approval to notify the Building
Official of any changes in material information submitted in the application upon which the approval and certification
is based, including, but not limited to, changes in personnel identified in the application or changes in licensing,
registration, or certification status. The Building Official shall provide a notice to any Third-Party Plans Review Agency

~13- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290031A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

or Third-Party Plans Reviewer of denial of certification and the reason for the denial.

110.4.3 Scope of Third-Party Plan Review. When approving a Third-Party Plans Reviewer or Third-Party Plans
Review Agency, the Building Official shall specify the review disciplines of the permit construction documents that
the plans reviewer or plans review agency is authorized fo review. Each approved Third-Party Plans Reviewer
or Third-Party Plans Review Agency shall be assigned a number. The areas in which a Third-Party Plans
Reviewer or Third-Party Plans Review Agency may be certified may include any of the following:
Architectural/Structural, Mechanical, Plumbing, or Electrical. The Energy Conservation Code requirements shall
be reviewed by each of the disciplines for compliance with the applicable Energy Conservation Code
requirements of the City of Albuquerque, Third-Party Plan Reviews of disciplines other than these will not be
accepted.

110.4.4 Third-Party Review Restriction: A Third-Party Plans Reviewer or Third-Parly Plans Review Agency shall not
perform plan review on a project which might present a conflict of interest due to their association with the project
or to their relationship or association with other parties or individuals involved with the project, its design or
construction.

110.4.5 Third-Party Construction Documents Review Procedures. In order to participate, the property owner,
agent, or permit applicant shall advise the Building Safety Division, in writing, at the time of application that a
certified Third-Party Plans Reviewer or Third-Party Plans Review Agency will review one or more disciplines of the
construction documents in conformity with the provisions of applicable laws, codes, and ordinances. Standard plan
review fees shall be paid at the time of application.

The said construction documents shall be reviewed by the Third-Party Flans Reviewer or Third-Party Plans Review
Agency and recommended for submissionfapproval in a ceriified report provided to the Building Official. The fees
paid to the Third-Party Plans Reviewer or Third-Party Plans Review Agency is independent and separate from any
fees required by this code and shall be the sole responsibility of the property owner, agent, or permit applicant.

110.4.6 Review of Work Conducted by Third-Party Plans Reviewers and Revocation of Approval. The
Building Official shall periodically canduct a detailed unannounced audit of documents reviewed by Third-Party
Plans Reviewers and Third-Party Plans Review Agencies, and shall also maintain a tracking system to monitor the
recommendations of the third-party plans reviewers. If the Building Official determines that plans recommended by
the Third-Party Plans Reviewer or Third-Party Plans Review Agency review agency for approval do not meet the
requirements of the Technical Codes or that the reviewer or agency has failed to meet other requirements of this
section, or any regulations promulgated there under, the Building Official is authorized to revoke the approval of the
Third-Party Plans Reviewer or Third-Party Plans Review Agency upon written notice, including the reason for the
revocation. The approval may be reinstated if the Building Official determines that the Third-Party Plans Reviewer
or Third-Party Plans Review has remedied the violation that formed the basis for the revocation and all requirements
of Section 110.4.1 are met,

110.4.7 Notice of Revocation. The Building Official shall provide the Third-Party Plans Review Agency or
Third-Party Plans Reviewer with written notice of his or her decision fo remove or suspend the Third-Party Plans
Review Agency or Third-Party Plans Reviewer from the Third-Party Program. The written notice shall also
provide explanation for the removal or suspensicn. The decision shall become effective upon service of the
notice in accordance with Section 110.4.8.

110.4.8 Service of Notice of Revocation. The Building Official shall affect service of a notice to revoke approval
by one of the following methods:

1. Personal service on the Third-Party Agency, Reviewer, or their agent; or
Delivering the notice to the last known home or business address of the Third-Party Agency or Reviewer
as identified by the Third-Party Reviewers application, the tax records, cr business license records, and
leaving it with a person over the age of sixteen (16) years old residing or employed therein; or
Mailing the notice, via first class mail postage prepaid, to the last known home or business address of the
Third-Party Agency, reviewer, or their agent as identified by the Third-Party Reviewer's application, the tax
records, or business license records; or
If the notice is returned as undeliverable by the Post Office authorities, or if no address is known or can be
ascertained by reasonable diligence, by posting a copy of the notice in a conspicuous place in or about the
structure affected by such notice.

-14- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code f



Docusign Envelope ID: B2830091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

110.4.9 Appeal. The Building Official's decision to deny certification, revoke certification or deny reinstatement of
the certification may be appealed to the Appeals Committee within 10 days of service pursuant to Section 107 of
the Uniform Administrative Code of the City of Albuquerque, but the filing of an appeal will not stay the effectiveness
of the decision.

110.4.1¢ Amended Construction Documents. All work shall conform to the approved application and plans for
which the permit has been issued and any approved amendments to them. Any changes made during construction
which deviate substantively from the approved plans shall be resubmitted for approval by the Building Safety
Division.

110.4.11 Interpretations. See Section 105.1 of the City of Albuguergue Uniform Administrative Code.

110.5 Expiration of Application and Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days
following the date of application shall expire by limitaticn. The Building Official may extend the time for action by the
applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days upon written request by the applicant showing that circumstances
beyond the control of the applicant have prevented action from being taken. Requests for extensions made after
an application has expired will not be granted. No application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew
action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee.

If the application has expired by limitation and has had a substantial review in the discretion of the Building Official

and the applicant is resubmitiing the same set of plans subject to the same codes, the applicant shall be charged
an hourly rate for plan review of the resubmitted plans. If the application has expired by limitation, and the applicant

is resubmitting either new plans or the plans are subject to a new code cycle, then the standard plan review fees
shall apply.

Trade permits that do not require the submission of plans shall not be renewed and a new permit shall be required.]

SECTION 111 -- PERMIT ISSUANCE

111.1 Issuance. Only an individual, firm, partnership, or corporation duly licensed as a contractor by the
Construction Industries Division of the State of New Mexico, will be issued a permit unless such individual, firm,
partnership, or corporation is exempt under NMSA [Section] 60-13-3 D.

Exception 1: A homeowner may be issued a permit to build a single-family residence and or garage for
their own use.

Exception 2:  An electrical or plumbing permit may be issued to a homeowner who successfully completes
a written plumbing and/or electrical exam with a score of 75% or greater. The
Electrical/Plumbing Section shall administer the written exams to qualified homeowners who
complete the Homeowner's Responsibility Form. Homeowners will be allowed four (4} hours
to complete each exam. Homeowners who do not pass an exam may take that exam one
additional time after waiting 30 days.

Exception 3:  Persons bidding or contracting for the installation of a solar PV electric system must possess
a valid license issued by the division with the EE-98, EL-1 or ER-1 license classification, as
applicable. If structural modifications are required, a GB-02 license classification is allowed
for residential construction and otherwise a GB-98 license classification is mandated.

The application, plans and specifications, and other data, filed by an applicant for permit shall be reviewed by the
Building Official. Such plans may be reviewed by other departments of this jurisdiction to verify compliance with
any applicable laws under their jurisdiction. If the Building Official finds that the work described in an application for
a permit and the plans, specifications, and other data filed therewith conform to the requirements of this Code and
the Technical Codes and cther pertinent laws and ordinances, and that the fees specified in Section 112 have been
paid, a permit therefore shall be issued to the applicant.

When the Building Officlal issues the permit where plans are required, he shall endorse in writing or stamp the plans

-15- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Dacusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

and specifications "APPROVED". Such approved plans and specifications shall not be changed, modified, or altered
without authorization from the Building Official, and all work regulated by this Code shall be done in accordance
with the approved plans.

The Building Official may issue a permit for the construction of part of a building, structure, or building service
equipment before the entire plans and specifications for the whole building, structure, or building service equipment
have been submitted or approved, provided adequate information, and detafled statements have been filed
complying with all pertinent requirements of the Technical Codes. The holder of such permit shall proceed at his
own risk without assurance that the permit for the entire building, structure, or building service will be granted. A
permit that is issued for a foundation only will require a building permit before work progresses beyond the
foundation stage. Work permitted under a foundation permit shall be limited to footings, foundation walls, Site
Utilities, and any other construction up to and including a first floor slab.

A separate permit shall be required for a sign or signs for each business entity, and/or a separate permit shall be
required for each group of signs on a single supporting structure. [Address]

Plumbing, Mechanical, and Electrical Permits for Multiple Buildings or Structures. Where multiple buildings or
structures are constructed on the same property or lot, under one ownership, separate permits are required for
gach building or structure on separate foundations. The address and building identifier shall be included on each
permit submitted, and each permit will be charged an administration fee of $23.50. For townhouse construction a
separate permit is required for each townhouse within the cluster. Each permit shall include an accurate count of
all equipment to be installed for that building or structure.

Where the City Council has, by resoclution, made a finding that a building, structure, or premise is so ruined,
damaged, and dilapidated that it is such a menace to the public comfort, health, peace, or safety so as to require
removal, no new permits will be issued for the site, other than for the purposes of removal and abatement, until
such time as the removal and abatement activities are completed, and the purposes for which the resolution was
enacted are fulfilled.

Roof structures or assemblies and other areas used to connect buildings or structures together will not negate this
requirement.

Where gas meters are installed on multi-occupancy buildings, separate permits are required for each meter. The
address, building identifier and unit or space number shall be included on each permit submitted and each permit
will be charged an Administrative Fee of $23.50.

111.2 Retention of Plans. One set of approved plans and specifications shall be returned to the applicant and
shall be kept on the site in a safe and accessible place of the building or work at all times during which the work
authorized thereby is in progress. One set of approved plans, specifications, and computations shall be retained by
the Building Official.

111.3 Validity of Permit. The issuance of a permit or approval of plans, specifications, and computations shali not
be construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this Code or the Technical
Codes, or of any other ordinance of the jurisdiction. Permits presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the
provisions of this Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid.

The issuance of a permit based upeon plans, specifications, and other data shall not prevent the Building Official
from thereafter requiring the correction of errors in said plans, specifications, and other data, or from preventing
building operations being carried on there under when in violation of these codes or of any other ordinances of this
jurisdiction.

111.4 Expiration of Permit. Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this code shall
expire by limitation and become null and void and the work deemed abandoned if:

1. The permiitee has not made a request to the Building Cfficial for an inspection [of the permit, or in the case of
a building permit, any associated trade permits] required by this code within 180 days from the date the permit
was issued, or

-16- [2024] [2823] City of Albuguergque Uniform Administrative Code



Dacusign Eavelope ID; B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

The permittee has not received an approval from the Building Official for an entire inspection required by
this code at any time after the work is commenced for a period of 180 days, or

The permittee has not made a request to the Building Official for a Certificate of Occupancy within 180
days of the final inspection.

The Building Official may extend the time for action by the permittee for a period of 180 days upon written request
by the permittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented action from being
taken. Requests for extensions made after the permit has expired will not be granted. No permit shall be extended
mere than once. In order to renew action on a permit after expiration [when there has been a change in any
technical code since the permit's issuance], the permittee shall re-apply for a permit, re-submit plans and
specifications for review [to meet the current adopted technical codes] and pay new plan review and permit fees. [in
order to renew action on a permit after expiration, when there has been no change in any technical code since the
permit's issuance, the permitee shall re-apply for a permit and pay new permit fees.] |f re-application is not made
within 180 days of permit expiration, the Building Official shall declare the project to be abandoned. The Building
Official may refuse to issue permits for new projects to the permittee of an abandoned project.

Trade Permits], Demolition Permits and Minor Alteration and Repair Permits shail expire by limitation and become
null and void after 180 days from the date the permit was issued.

111.5 Suspension or Revocation. The Building Official may, in writing, suspend or revoke a permit issued under
the provisions of this Code and the Technical Codes whenever the permit is issued in error, on the basis of incorrect
information supplied, or in violation of any ordinance, regulation, or any of the provisions of these codes.

SECTION 112 -- FEES
112.1 General. Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the provisions of this section.

112.2 Permit Fees. The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in Tables 112-A through 112-H, Where a
technical code has been adopted by the jurisdiction for which no fee schedule is shown in this Code, the fee
required shall be in accordance with the schedule established by the council.

112.2.1 Building Permit Valuations. The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit value at time of
application. Permit valuations shall include total value of work, including materials and labor, for which the permit
is being issued, such as electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing equipment and other building service equipment. If,
in the opinion of the Building Official, the valuation is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied,
unless the applicant can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the Building Official. Final building permit
valuation shall be set by the Bullding Official.

The Albuguerque regional modifier shall be applied to all tables in accordance with the schedule established by
the legislative body as follows:

The Albuquerque Regional Modifier for Table112-A Building Permit Fees shall be (.67) for apartments, public and
commercial construction. (Minimum fee shall be $23.50.)

The Albuquerque Regional Modifier for Table 112-A Building Permit Fees shall be (.50) for one- and two-family
dwelling and town-house construction, including renovations, alterations and additions. (Minimum fee shall be
$23.50).

The Albuquergue regional modifier for Table 112-B Electrical Permit Fees shall be {1.0).
The Albuquerque regional modifier for Table 112-C Mechanical Permit Fees shall be (1.0).
The Albuguerque regional modifier for Table 112-D Plumbing Permit Fees shall be {1.0).
The Albuquerque regional modifier for Table 112-E Sign Permit Fees shail be (1.0).

The Albuquerque regional modifier for Table 112-F Wall Permit Fees shall be (1.0).

The Albuguerque regional modifier for Table 112-G Re-Roof Permit Fees shall be (1 .0).

-17- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquergque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290051A-86E8-4F82-8AB1-11A2AF2B5344

112.3 Plan Review Fees. When a plan or other data is required to be submitted by Sections 110.2 and 110.3, a
plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for review. Said pian review fee for
buildings, signs, or structures shall be 65 percent of the building or sign permit fee as shown in Tables 112-A and
112-E.

City Projects shall submit a Promise to Pay form prior to plan review.

The plan review fees for electrical, mechanical, and plumbing, shall be equal to 25 percent of the total permit fee
as set forth in Tables 112-B, 112-C, and 112-D.

The plan review fees specified in this subsection are separate fees fram the permit fees specified in Section 112.2
and are in addition to the permit fees,

Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, an additional plan review fee shall
be charged at the rate shown in Tables 112-A through 112-H.

The fee for rechecking lost or worn-out plans for which a permit has previously been issued shall be charged at the
rate shown in Table 112-A.

The fee for checking more than two sets of plans (duplicate sets) shall be charged at the rate shown in
Table 112- A.

The fee for the checking and consultation time requested by the applicant for a preliminary plan review shall be
charged at the rate shown in Table 112-A. In all cases the applicant must be prepared with the basic code data
and not be dependent upon the Building Official for this information.

112.4 Investigation Fees. Work Without a Permit.

112.4.1 Investigation. Whenever any work for which a permit is required by this Code has been commenced
without first obtaining a permit, a special investigation may be made before a permit may be issued for such work.

112.4.2 Fee. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or
subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit fee required by this Code.
The minimum investigation fee shall be the same as the minimum fee set forth in Tables 112-A through 112-H. The
payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of either
this Code or the Technical Codes nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

112.5 Fee Refunds. The Building Official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid hereunder which was
arroneously paid or collected.

The Building Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has
been done under a permit issued in accordance with this Code.

The Building Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an
application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan
reviewing is done.

The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written application filed by
the original permit holder not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

-18- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquergue Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope |D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF 285344

TABLE 112-A BUILDING PERMIT FEES

TOTAL VALUATION FEES
$1.00 to $500.00 $23.50
$23.50 for the first $500.00 plus $3.05 for each additional $100.00 or fraction
thereof, to and including $2,000.00.
$69.25 for the first $2,000.00 plus $14.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or
fraction thereof, to and including $25,000.00.
$391.75 for the first $25,000.00 plus $10.10 for each additional $1,000.00 or
fraction thereof, to and including $50,000.00
$643.75 for the first $50,000.00 plus $7.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or
fraction thereof, to and including $100,000.00.
$993.75 for the first $100,000.00 plus $5.60 for each additional $1,000.00 or
fraction thereof.

$501.00 to $2,000.00

$2,001.00 to $25,000.00

$25,001.00 to $50,000.00

$50,001.00 to $100,000.00

$100.001.00 and up

Other Inspections and Fees:

Inspections outside of normal business hours (minimum charge two-hours) $47.00 per hour

Re-inspection fee assessed under provisions of Section 113.5.8 $47.00 each

Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated {minimum charge two-hours}| $47.00 per hour

Additional plan review changes, additions, revisions to approved plans (minimum | $47.00 per hour
charge two-hours)

Additional plan review required by rechecking lost or worn-out plans

1/2 plan check fee

Duplicate sets of plans: Each set.

1/2 plan check fee

Preliminary and integrated plan review

$75.00 per hour

Demolition Permit Fee:

« for wrecking and demolition up to and including1500 sq. ft. of floor
area including all floors and basements

$47.00

« Each additional 500 sq. ft. or fraction thereof

$10.00

Temporary Certificate of Qccupancy

$100.00

Certificate of Occupancy

$50.00

TABLE 112-B ELECTRICAL PERMIT FEES

Administrative charge applicable to all applications and additions to permits
EXCEPTION: re-inspection fee
Meter loop 06 [$40.00] each
{a) | Temporary meters (separate permit required) 06 [$40.00] each
(b) | Ganged meters $60.00] per

[ $23-50 [$47.00] each

Outlets {Communication and signal, fixtures, switches, and receptacles):
{(a) | First20 -5 [$ 1.50] each
{b) | Allover 20 45 [$ 0.90] each

Installation of commercial lighting fixtures
(a) | First 20 5 [$ 1.50] each
{b) | All over 20 $-0:50 [$ 1.00] each

When fluorescent lighting is installed in continuous rows, each unit shall be considered a separate
fixture. (The term fixture shall be interpreted to mean the lighting device at any outlet.)

-19- [2024] [2023] City of Albugquerque Uniform Administrative Code




Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Motor Operated Equipment:
{a) | Less than one horsepower unit 00 [$ 8.00] each
{(b) | One horsepower and over, based on total horsepower of all motors in any 00 [$20.00] each

one unit {per horsepower .
(¢) | Maximum fee per unit $20-00 [$40.00] each

Evaporative Coolers (any size) $-4-00 [$ 8.00] each

Panels $-4-00 [$ 8.00] each

Residential Fixed Appliances (30 amps or over) $-4-00 [$ 8.00] each

Sign Conneactions $20-00 [$40.00] each

Transformers 8400 [$ 8.00] each

Space Heating Equipment: (Each Unit) Per 1000 watt $-4.00 [$ 8.00] each

Communication and Signal: Min, each system $40.00 [$20.00] each

Pre-final $20.00 [$40.00] each

Swimming pool {Public) $443-00 [$80.00] each

Swimming pool (Private) $34-00 [$60.00] each

Other equipment as specified $-4.00 [$ 8.00] each

Other Inspections and Fees:
1. Installation for which no fee is prescribed $47.00 per hour
{(Minimum charge two-hours)
2. Re-inspection fee assessed under provisions of Section 113.5.8 $47.00 per hour
3. Overtime and after-hour inspections $47.00 per hour
(Minimum charge two-hours)

TABLE 112-C MECHANICAL PERMIT FEES

Administrative charge applicable to all applications and additions to permit $23.50 [$47.00]
each

EXCEPTICN: re-inspection fee
Gas line test with no outlets or appliances $-5.00 [$10.00]
each
Recording chart test or other high-pressure test $-8.00[$16.00]
each
Temporary gas (shall not exceed 90 days) $20.00 [$40.00]
each

No temporary gas shall be allowed before October 1 or after April 30
Gas outlet $-3.00[$ 6.00]
each
Each appliance, includes plenums and venting $—?—hQG [$14.00]
eac

NOTE: This does not include boilers, refrigeration units, air conditioning units, or absarption units[.]

For the repair, alteration of, or addition to each heating appliance, refrigeration unit,
cooling unit, boiler, absorption or evaporative cooling system, including installation of

controls regulated by this Code $-8.00 [$16.00]
each

For the installation or relocation of each absorption system up to and including 100,000
B.T.U. input; and each condensing unit to and including 36,000 B.T.U. output. $41-00 [$22.00]
gach

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or each absorption system over 100,000
B.T.U. inpuf up to and including 500,000 B.T.U. input, and each condensing unit over

36,000 B.T.U. output to and including 180,000 B.T.U. output, $29H09 [$40.00]
eac

For the instaliation or relocation of each boiler or each absorption system over 500,000
B.T.U. input to and including 1,000,000 B.T.U. input, and each condensing unit over

180,000 B.T.U. cutput to and including 360,000 B.T.U. output. $2—7;‘99 [$54.00]
eag

-20- [2024] [2623] City of Albuguerque Uniform Administrative Code




Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2ZAF2B5344

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or each absorption system over
1,000,000 B.T.U. input to and including 1,750,000 B,T.U input, and each condensing

unit over 360,000 B.T.U. output to and including 600,000 B.T.U. output 340;]09 [$80.00]
eac

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or each absorption system over

1,750,000 B.T.U. input and each condensing unit over 600,000 B.T.U. output. $€7;GG ($134.00]
eac

Faor each air handling unit including ducts attached thereto (charged as an appliance) $ 700 [$14.00]
each
NOTE: This fee shall not apply to an air handling unit which is a portion of a factory assembled
appliance cooling unit, evaporative cooler or absorption unit far which a permit is required elsewhere in
this Code.
For each evaporative cooler other than portable type $—£00 [314.00]
each

For each ventilation fan connected to a single duct $-7.00 [$14.00]
each

For each ventilation system or heating or air conditioning duct work system authorized

by a permit $7.00 [$14.00]
each

For the installation of each hood, which is served by mechanical exhaust including the

ducts for such hood $-700 [$14.00]
each

For the instaltation or relocation of each crematory or pathological destructor $45.00 [$90.00]
each

For each appliance or piece of equipment required by this Code but not classed in

other appliance categories, or for which no cther fee is listed in this Code $7.001$14.00]
each

For solar collectors (including related piping, duct work and regulating devices):
{a) | Up to 1000 sq. ft. $-4.00 [$ 8.00]
(b) | 1001 sq. ft. to 2000 sq. ft. $-6.001$12.00)
{c) | More than 2000 sq. it. $ 6.00[%12.00

plus $1.50 per 1000 sq. ft. or fraction thereof over 2000 sq

For solar storage tanks (including refated piping and regulating devices):
{a) | Up to 750 gallons $-3.00$ 6.00
{b) | 751 gallens to 2000 gallons $4-00%8.00
{c) | More than 2000 gallons $-4.601% 8.00

plus $1.50 per 1000 gallons or fraction thereof over 2000 gallons

For solar rock storage;

{ay [ Up to 1500 cu. ft. $-3.00 [$ 6.00]

(b} [ 1501 cu. ft. to 3000 cu. Ft $—4-00 [ 8.00

(c) | More than 3000 cu. fi. $—4-00 [$ 8.00
plus $1.50 per 1000 cu. ft. or fraction thereof over 3000 cu. fi.

Other Inspections and Fees:
1. Overtime and after-hour inspections {(Minimum charge two-hours) $47.00 per hour
2. Re-inspection fee assessed under provisions of Section 113.5.8 $47.00 each

BOILER INSPECTIONS

Certificate of Inspection:
(a} A boiler Certificate of Inspection and subsequent maintenance inspections shall be obtained by the
property owner through a certified third-party inspection as required by law per NMAC Section 14.9.4.

-21- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2ZAF2B5344

TABLE 112-D PLUMEING PERMIT FEES

Administrative charge applicable to all applications and additions to permit

$23.50 [547.00]

each

EXCEPTION: re-inspection fee

Gas line test with no outlets or appliances

$-5.00 [$10.00]
each

Recording chart test or other high-pressure test

$-8:00 [$16.00]
each

Temporary gas for heating shall not exceed 90 days. No temporary gas shall be allowed
before October 1 or after April 30

$20.00 [$40.00]

each

(GGas outlet

$-3-00 [$ 6.00]
each

Plumbing fixture includes drain and vent

$-5.00 [$10.00]

each

Water distribution system (Also pool filling system, including back-flow prevention)

$-7-00 [$14.00]

each

Water service (from property line to house or building)

$-2.00[$14.00]

For new storm sewer or sanitary sewer tap inspection (connection to public storm or sanitary
sewer)

$-9:00 [$18.00]
each

House or building sewer (from property line to house or building) including 2-way cleanout

$14.00 [$28.00]

each

Lawn sprinkler system on any one meter including backflow protection devices thereof

$-0.00 [518.00]

For atmospheric-type vacuum breakers not included in ltem 11 above:

1to05

$7507515.00]

over5

$150 [$ 3.00]

each

For each backilow protective device other than atmospheric-type vacuum breakers: (ALSO F

OR REPAIR)

2 inches and smaller

$15.00]

over 2 inches

[$30.00]

For sewer repair in public street

[$16.00]

Roof drain {piping)

$-6;90 [$12.00]

each

Septic tank or cesspool

$40-00 [$80.00]
each

Swimming pool (public)

$40-00 [$80.00]

each

Swimming pool (private)

$30-00 [$60.00]
each

19.

Automatic fire extinguishing system, type | hood, wet standpipe system, dry standpipe
system, combination standpipe system installed in a building (in addition to all associated
Albuguerque Fire Department fees)

$50.00

20.

Utility service lines 300, section {or portion) sewer collecting lines

$20.00

21.

Utility service lines sewer connection outlets

$ 6.00]

22,

Utility service lines manholes

$16.00]

23,

Utility service lines 300, section (or portion) water service lines

[$20.00]

24,

Utility service lines water connection outlets

$ 6.00

25.

Fire hydrant inspection

$16.00]

26.

Interceptor or sewer ejector pump

$T2.00 [§24.00]
each

27,

For each fixture or piece of equipment required by this Code but not classed in other
fixture categories, or for which no other fee is listed in this Code

$5:60 [$10.00]

Other Inspections and Fees:

-22-

[2024} [2023] City of Albuqguergque Uniform Administrative Code B




Docusign Envelope |D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

1. Overtime and after-hour inspection (minimum charge two-hours) $47.00 per hour
2. Re-inspection fee assessed under provisions of Section 113.5.8 $47.00 each
3.

TABLE 112-E SIGN PERMIT FEES

A sign permit fee shall be paid in accordance with the following schedule:

SIZE OF SIGN FEE
2to20sq. fi $15.00
over 20 to 100 sq. it $30.00
over 100 sq. ft ' $45.00
Note: Separate electrical permits are required for electrical signs, see Table 112-B

Other Inspections and Fees:

Inspections outside of normal business hours $47.00 per hour
(Minimum charge-two hours)

Re-inspection fee assessed under provisions of Section 113.5.8 $47.00 each
Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated $47.00 per hour
{Minimum charge two-hours)

Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to approved plans $47.00 per hour
{Minimum charge two-hours)

TABLE 112-F WALL PERMIT FEES

Fence And Wall Construction Cost Guide Per Lineal Foot

HEIGHT OF WALL
2! 3 4 g g
Cmu* Garden Wall $55.40
Adobe Garden Wall $95.50
Wood Stud/Stucco Wall $92.40
Wood Fence {Cedar) $31.00

Chain Link Fence $16.00

Cmu* Retaining Wall 1, 2, 6" $61.00
Cmu* Retaining Wall 1, 2, 8" $67.40
Concrete Retaining Wall 3' $118.75
* cement masonry unit

Footnotes:
1. Add 15% for reinforcement greater than code minimum

TABLE 112-G RE-ROOF PERMIT FEES

Residential {(R-3 Occupancies Only)
Administrative Fee Inspection Fee Total

$45-00 [$30.00] $20.00 [$40.00] $35:00 [$70.00]

-23- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-B6E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Commercial (Apartments R-1, R-2, R-4 and All Other Occupancies)

Valuation Administrative Inspection Fee
Fee
$501 - $5,000 -00 [$50.00] 00 [$50.00] 88 [$100.00
$5,001 - %$10,000 00 [$50.00 00 [$70.00 -89 [$120.00
$10,001 — $20,000 06 [$50.00 00 [$110.00] 00 [$160.00
$20,001 - $30,000 00 [$50.00 00 [$190.00] -00 [$240.00
$30,001 - $40,000 -00 [$50.00 80 [$270.00 00 [$320.00]
$40,001 - $50,000 00 [$50.00 -00-[$350.00 -00 [$400.00
Over— $ 50,000 00 [$50.00 -80 [$430.00 -00 [$480.00

SECTION 113 -- INSPECTIONS

113.1 General. Construction or work for which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the Building
Official and the construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes until approved
by the Building Official.

Approval as a result of an inspection shall not be construed to be an approval of a violation of the provisions of this Cod
or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Inspecticns presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions o
this Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid.

it shall be the duty of the permit holder to cause the work to be completed and remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes. The equipment, material and labor necessary for inspection or tests shail be furnished by the
person to whom the permit is issued or by whom inspection is requested. Neither the Building Official nor this
jurisdiction shall be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement of any material required to allow
inspection.

A survey of the lot may be required by the Building Official to verify that the structure is located in accordance with
the approved plans.

113.2 Permit Notice. Work requiring a building permit shall not be commenced until the permit holder or his agent
shall have posted a permit notice with the street address on it in a conspicuous, safe and accessible place on the
premises. This card shall be maintained in such position by the permit holder until final approval has been issued
by the Building Official.

113.3 Inspection Requests. [t shall be the duty of the permit holder doing the work authorized by a permit to notify
the Building Official that such work is ready for inspection. Notification shall include at least the following: correct
street address, suite number and/or building number, type of inspection, permit holder's name, permit number
andfor sub-permit number. The Building Official may require that every request for inspection be filed at least one
working day before such inspection is desired. Such request may be in writing or by telephone at the option of the
Building Official. it shall be the duty of the permit holder requesting any inspections required either by this Code or
the Technical Codes fo provide access [ts] and means for inspection of such work. It shall be the duty of the permit
holder requesting any inspection to ensure that the permit notice card is conspicuously posted.

Exception: If a bullding permit is not required, it shall be the duty of the plumbing, mechanical, or electrical
permit holder to ensure that the address is conspicuously posted.

When a correction notice is issued, a re-inspection must be requested by the applicant.

Cancelation Fee: A $47.00 fee will be assessed to the permit holder if a scheduled inspection is canceled ess than
24 hours before the scheduled inspection. See Table 112-A Other inspections and fees, item 3.

-24- 12024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code §



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

113.4 Approval Required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each successive inspection
without first obtaining the approval of the Building Official. Such approval shall be given only after an inspection
shall have been made of each successive step in the construction as indicated by each of the inspections required
by the following subsections detailing the required inspections. The Building Official, upon notification, shall make
the requested inspections and shall either indicate that portion of the construction is satisfactory as completed or
shall notify the permit holder or his agent when the same fails to comply with this Code. Any portions which do not
compiy shall be corrected and no portion shall be covered or concealed until authorized by the Building Official.

There shall be a final inspection and approval of all buildings, building service equipment, and structures when
completed and ready for occupancy and use.

113.5 Required Inspections.

113.5.2 Required Building Inspections, Reinforcing steel or structural framework for any part of any building or
structure shall not be covered or concealed without first obtaining the approval of the Building Official.

The Building Official, upon notification from the permit holder or his agent, shall make the following inspections
and shall either approve that portion of the construction as completed or shall notify the permit holder or his agent
wherein the same fails to comply with this Code.

1. Foundation Inspection: Footing and foundation inspections shall be made after excavations for footing
are complete and any required reinforcing steel is in place. For concrete foundations, any required forms
shall be in place prior to inspection. Materials for the foundation shall be on the job, except where concrete
is ready-mixed in accordance with ASTM C94 the concrete need not be on the job. Where the foundation
Is to be constructed of approved treated wood, additional inspections may be required by the Building
Official. Compaction Reports may be requested at the time of inspection.

Foundation Insulation Inspection: To be made after insulation has been installed around the perimeter
of slab on grade floors.

Frame Inspection: To be made after the roof decking and underlayment, all framing, fire blocking, draft
stopping, bracing, framed openings for exterior doors and windows are in place, and all pipes, electrical
wiring, chimneys, duct work and vents are approved.

Frame Insulation Inspection: To be made after insulation and vapor barriers have been installed in
frame walls, floors, and ceilings or roofs.

Exterior Lath and/or Wallboard Inspection: To be made after all exterior lathing is in place; but before
any plastering is applied. Wallboard inspection to be made on all firewalls, wet areas, and shear walls
before wallboard joints and fasteners are taped and finished.

Final Inspection: To be made after building is completed and ready for occupancy and before it is
occupied. A final inspection shall be called for by the permit holder.

Demolition Final Inspection: To be made after the building is demolished, all materials have been
removed from the site, and vacant lot has been filled to existing grade and leveled.

Re-roof and Solar Inspections: To be made after the installation is complete. A certified Building
Inspector may view photos of the permitted work which have been captured by a UAS Drone operator. If
necessary, a second inspection will be done by a certified Building Inspector on site.

Partial inspections: When necessary, due to construction requirements, partial inspections may be
made. This requires specific details as to what portion is to be inspected.

Some projects shall require multiple inspections within a category as listed above. It shall be the responsibility of
the General Contractor or a homeowner with a valid homeowner's permit to notify the Building Official and request
such additional inspections for these categories as the project progresses.

113.5.2 Required Electrical Inspections. The following is a list of required electrical inspections and the
customary terms, It should be noted that the number and type of inspections are not limited to the following and
that more inspections may be required by the complexity of some jobs.

1. Rough-in: After conduits, cables, wires, cabinets, and boxes are installed within a structure and before
insulation is installed or wall and ceilings are covered, a rough-in inspection is required. All splicing of
wires must be completed and neutrals and grounds must be terminated in boxes and panels. Bonding
jumpers for metal boxes must be installed.

=25- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Bocusign Envelope [D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Low Voltage Rough-in: After all cables, wires, cabinets, and boxes are installed within a structure and
before insulation is installed or wall and ceilings are covered, a low voltage rough-in is required.
Pre-final: All service equipment, service conduits, service conductors, bonding jumpers, and points of
attachment must be installed. At least one grounding electrode and associated grounding electrode
conductor must be installed. For ¢t type metering, current transformers must be instalied.
Underground: After underground conduits, cables, and conductors are installed and before covering
them an underground inspection is required.
Slab: After conduits, boxes, grounding electrode conductors, or electrical equipment are installed within a
concrete slab and before concrete is poured a slab inspection is required.
Low Voltage Final: After all low voliage equipment has been installed a low voltage final is required.
Final: When all electrical equipment is installed and all electrical wiring is completed a final inspection is
required.
Temporary Power: For temporary power during construction, remodeling, or where power is needed for
other temporary needs a temporary power inspection is required. All services, other power sources, and
all wiring associated with the temporary power installation must be inspected.
Service Upgrades or Replacement: When electrical services are upgraded or replaced inspections are
required,
. Signs: After a sign has been installed or erected, all electrical wiring has been completed on or in the sign

and all electrical circuits have been completed to the sign, a sign final is required.

11. Swimming Pools: The equipotential bonding grid, the underground conduits, and a final inspection are
required oh all pools.

12. Partial Inspections; When necessary, due to construction requirements, partial inspections may be
made. This requires specific details as to what portion is to be inspected.

113.5.3 Required Mechanical and Solar Energy Inspections. The following is a list of required Mechanical
Inspections and the customary terms and order in which they are ususally called. It should be noted that the
number and type of inspections are not limited to the following and that more inspections may be required by the
complexity of some jobs.

1. Underground Duct: For listed approved plastic ducts: This inspection includes all ductwork covered by
the permit to be buried underground. The inspection shall be requested after the ductis installed, but before
it is covered or backfilled with any material. With metal ducts, the inspection shall be requested after the
proper insulation has been installed, but before it is covered or backfilled with any material.

. Heating Top Out: This inspection shall include all ductwork and vents above grade covered by the
permit, which will be covered or concealed. This inspection shall be called before any of the ducts or
vents above grade are covered or concealed.

Gas Line Test: Gas piping systems with a working pressure of less than 2 psi, or a working pressure of 2
psi and having two outlets or fewer, shali be considered a low-pressure system, This inspection shall include
an air pressure test, at which time the gas piping shall stand a pressure of not less than 10 pounds per
square inch gauge pressure using a 15-psi gauge with 1/10% increments. Test pressures shall be held for
a length of fime satisfactory to the Building Official, but in no case for less than fifteen (15) minutes with no
perceptible drop in pressure. All gas stops must be installed and capped, or attached fo the appliance.
High Pressure Test: Gas piping systems with a working pressure of 2 psi with 3 or more outlets, or a
system with a working pressure of more than 2 psi, shall be considered a high-pressure system and shall
be tested with a minimum test pressure of 30 psi using a recording device for a period of 24 hours. For
minor repairs or installing a tee or fittings on existing high-pressure gas systems or welded piping, the
test shall be 60 psi for a period of 30 minutes.

Gas Line Final: Final inspection of all installations shall be made after all piping and shut off valves
covered by the permit has been installed and after all portions thereof which are to be concealed by
plastering or otherwise have been so concealed and after all non-portable gas appliances are installed. A
gas line test inspection is required even if a temporary gas inspection was made previously. The final test
is valid for sixty {60} days.

Appliance Final: An appliance final shall be made after the installation of an appliance, or appliances,
has been completed to meet this Code and manufacturer's installation instructions.

Temporary Gas Service: Temporary gas service shall be for a maximum of 90-day period. A Gas Line
test and an appliance inspection shall be required for temporary gas service. Before additional appliances
are connected, or approval for occupancy, a gas line final inspection shall be called for and approved. No
temporary gas for heating shalt be allowed after April 30 or before October 1.

-26- [2024] [2023] City of Albuguerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-B6E3-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF285344

8. Temporary Heat: Temporary Heat shall be for period of no more than 90 days. The single heating
appliance shall be permanently installed as per code and manufacturer's specifications. The furnace
closet or furnace area shall meet the fire rating specified in the construction documents. Enclosure doors
and duct registers need not be installed.

9. Boiler Inspection: This inspection shall be made after the instailation of the boiler is completed to meet
this Code and the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

10. Partial Inspections: When necessary, due to construction requirements, partial inspections may be
made. This requires specific details as to what portion is to be inspected.

113.5.4 Required Plumbing and Swimming Pool Inspections. The following is a list of required plumbing and
swimming pool inspections and the customary terrns and order in which they are usually called. It should be noted
that the number and type of inspections are not limited to the following and that more inspections may be required
by the complexity of some jobs,

1. Sewer Tap or Repair: Sewer tap and stub-in from a tee or a tapping a saddle on the sewer main to
private property line. Approval to tap the sewer is required from the Liquid Waste Engineer of the
ABCWUA,

Water Service: Water piping from the service meter to the connection outside of building. Metal pipe shall
be covered to a minimum of 28" below finished grade and in debris-free soil, Plastic pipe shall be covered
to a 28" depth below grade, on a smooth bed, and in debris-free soil. All piping shall be checked with a test
of not less than operating pressure. Backfill shall be free of any stones, metal, glass, etc., which could
cause damage to piping.

Building or House Sewer: Building sewer or house sewer shall be in accordance with Table 717.1 in the
Uniform Plumbing Code, of approved materials, at a minimum depth of 12", on a smooth bed, tamped
below pipe as required, and properly graded, and inspected before any backfill cover.

Sanitary Rough-in: All drain, waste, and vent piping below the first-floor level is to be filled with water for
a test and inspection to a minimum height of 10 feet above highest opening in the section being tested, An
air test with 5 psi pressure on an air gauge for fifteen minutes may be used if allowed by the material
manufacturer. This inspection also includes water distribution under a building.

Top-Out: Where a Sanitary rough-in inspection under a concrete floor has been made, the next
inspection is usually the top-out and includes all piping above the fioor to the extensions through the roof
and/or walls. Shower pans require a standing water test at time of rough-in inspection.

Rough Piping Inspection: Rough piping inspection of all piping installations shall be made after all piping
covered by the permit has been installed, and before any such piping has been covered or concealed, or
any appliances have been attached thereto; provided that the Building Official may expressly waive rough
piping under any particular permit where there is involved only an extension to existing piping for the
purpose of providing one or more additional gas outlets or plumbing fixtures for the same structure. This
inspection may be made at that time of the plumbing or heating top-out.

Plumbing Final: When all plumbing is compiete and the fixtures are installed and ready for use, a final
inspection shall be called for by the plumbing contractor.

Swimming Pool Inspections: A Pool Rough-In inspection is required on all work before it is concealed.
An inspection is required on the circulating lines, pool drain, water distribution, and house sewer
connection. Additional inspections may be needed for the sand trap, gas lines, and boilers. A pool final
inspection is required upon completion. An air test with 5 psi pressure on an air gauge for fifteen minutes
may be used if allowed by the material manufacturer.

Partial Inspections: When necessary, due to construction requirements, partial inspections may be
made. This requires specific details as to what portion is to be inspected.

113.5.5 Required Sign Inspections, All signs for which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the
Buiiding Official.

1. Footing Inspections shall be required by the Building Official for all signs having footings.
2. Finalinspection shall be required for ali signs.

All signs containing electrical wiring shall be subject to the provisions of the governing electrical code, and the
electrical sign and components used shall bear the label of an approved testing agency.

The Building Official may order the removal of any sign that is not maintained in accordance with provisions of
Section 102.4 of this Code.

-27- [2024] [2623] City of Alouquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF285344

All signs may be re-inspected at the discretion of the Building Official.

113.5.6 Other Inspections. In addition to the called inspections specified above, the Building Official may make or
require other inspections of any construction work to ascertain compliance with the provisions of this Code or
Technical Codes and other laws which are enforced by the Building Safety Division, For the purpose of determining
compliance with Section 102.4 of this Code, the Bullding Official may cause any structure to be re- inspected.

113.5.7 Inspections of Existing Structures. To verify modifications to bring existing structures up to code, the
Building Safety Division shall make inspections of existing structures when requested pravided the request meets

the following conditions:

1. Arequest, in writing, giving detalls of the type of inspection, or inspections, desired is received.

2. Arrangements are made, in advance, to pay the inspection fee,

3. An appointment is made to gain access to the property; keeping in mind that the inspection, or
inspections, shall be made at the convenience of the Building Official.

113.5.8 Re-inspections. A re-inspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or re-inspection when such
portion of work for which the inspection is called is not complete or when corrections called for are not made. A re-
inspection fee minimum two-hour charge will be assessed for work with no description, inaccurate description, or in
which no fee is prescribed.

This subsection is not to be interpreted as requiring re-inspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure to
comply with the requirements of the Technical Codes, but as controlling the practice of calling for inspections
before the job is ready for such inspection or re-inspection.

Re-inspection fees may be assessed in accordance with Tables 112-A — 112-H when the permit notice card and/or
address is not conspicuously posted on the work site, the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector,
for failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested, for deviating from plans reguiring the
approval of the Building Official, or for a second rejection for failure to comply with the requirements of this Code.

When re-inspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the work will be performed until the
required fees have been paid. When a correction notice is issued, a re-inspection must be requested by the
applicant.

113.5.9 Overtime and after hour inspection. Overtime and after hour inspection require 24-hour prior approval
by the section manager.

Exception: Emergencies where the utilities must be reconnected to or in occupied buildings or when other
lite safety issues need to be inspected.

SECTION 114 -- CONNECTION TC UTILITIES

114.1 Energy Connections. Persons shall not make connections from a source of energy, fuel, or power to
building service equipment, which is regulated by the Technical Codes and for which a permit is required by this
Code, until approved by the Building Official.

114.2 Temporary Connections. The Building Official may authorize the temporary connection of the building
service equipment to the source of energy, fuel, or power for the purpose of testing building service equipment, or
for use under a temporary Certificate of Occupancy.

114.3 Reconnection of utilities. Written authorization of the Building Official shall be required for any person,
firm, or corporation to re-cannect any gas, electrical, or water service if it has been ordered disconnected by the
Building Official.

114.4 Street Excavations. All utilities (plumbing, gas, sewer, water, electricity, telephone, and other cables)

-28- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code J



Bacusign Envelope |D; B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

making excavations as defined by Chapter 6, Article 5 Section 6-5-2-2 of the 2005 Street, Excavation and
Barricade Ordinance are required to comply with all provisions thereof.

SECTION 115 -- CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY AND CERTIFICATE OF SHELL COMPLETION

115.1 Use or Occupancy. Buildings or structures shall not be used or occupied, nor shall a change in the existing
occupancy classification of a building or structure or portion thereof be made until the Bullding Official has issued a
Certificate of Occupancy therefore as provided herein.

115.2 Change in Use. Changes in the character or use of a building shall not be made except as specified in the
Building Code.

115.3 Certificate of Occupancy Issued. A request for a Certificate of Occupancy shall be made by the owner or
his agent after final inspection approvals have been secured from all City departments or divisions involved in the
enforcement of pertinent codes, ordinances, or laws. The Building Official, after verification of all required, final
inspection approvals are recorded into the permitting and inspection database, shall issue a Certificate of
Qccupancy, which shall contain the following:

The building permit number.
The address of the structure,
The name and address of the owner.
A description of that portion of the structure for which the certificate is issued.
A statement that the described portion of the structure has been inspected for compliance with the
requirements of this code for the occupancy and division of occupancy and the use for which the proposed
occupancy is classified.
The authorization of the Building Official.
The edition of the code under which the permit was issued.
The use and occupancy, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 3 of the New Mexico Commercial
Building Code.
9. The type of construction as defined in Chapter 6 of the New Mexico Commercial Building Code.
10. The design occupant load.
11. Any special stipulations and conditions of the building permit

Failure to obtain a valid Certificate of Occupancy may result in penalties as described in Section 9 of this Ordinance.

115.4 Temporary Occupancy. The Building Official is authorized to issue a Temporary Certificate of Qccupancy
before the completion of the entire work covered by the permit, provided that such portion or portions shall be
occupied safely. The Building Official shall set a time period during which the Temporary Certificate of Occupancy
is valid.

Prior to the issuance of a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy, all fire/life safety issues, fire protection systems,
exiting, sanitary facilities, parking spaces, and accessibility provisions for the portions to be occupied must meet
code requirements. Inspection approvals for these areas must be secured from all City departments or divisions
involved in the enforcement of pertinent codes, ordinances or laws before the Temporary Certificate of Occupancy
is issued. In addition, temporary safety measures such as barricades and occupancy separation walls shall be
provided onsite to ensure occupants can safely ingress to and egress from the portion or portions of the building
for which the Temporary Certificate of Occupancy is to be issued.

A Temporary Certificate of Occupancy will be effective for 30 days. Thirty-day extensions may be granted by the
Building Official. Each department, section, or division that issued a temporary approval must re-inspect the area
before a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy may be extended.

Upon receipt of a written request for an extension of a current, valid Temporary Certificate of Occupancy, and
good cause being shown, the Temporary Certificate of Occupancy can be extended for 30 days, for a maximum
of 12 months total. An additional Temporary Certificate of Occupancy fee shall be paid, prior to approval, for each
extension, per Table 112-A Other inspections and fees, item 9.

-29- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope [D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

115.5 Certificate of Shell Completion. A request for a Certificate of Shell Compietion shail be made by the owner
or his agent after inspection approvals have been secured from all City departments or divisions involved in the
enforcement of pertinent codes, ordinances or laws. The Building Official, after notification of all inspection
approvals, shall issue a Certificate of Shell Completion which shall contain the following:

The shell building permit number.

The address of the structure.

The name and address of the owner.

A statement that the construction of the shell is complete and is in compliance with the requirements of this
Code.

The authorization of the Building Official.

The edition of the code under which the permit was issued.

The type of construction as defined in Chapter 6 of the New Mexico Commercial Building Code.

If an automatic sprinkler system is provided.

Any special stipulations and conditions of the building permit.

A Certificate of Occupancy and Temporary Certificate of Occupancy will not be issued until Certificate of Shell
Completion has been issued. Failure to obtain a valid Certificate of Shell Completion may result in penalties as
described in Section 9 of this Ordinance.

115.6 Posting. The Certificate of Occupancy shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the premises and shall
not be removed except by the Building Official.

115.7 Revocation. The Building Official may in writing, suspend or revoke a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy,
Certificate of Occupancy, or Shell Certificate of Completion at any time if the cerlificate was issued in error, issued
on the basis of incorrect information supplied, or where it is determined that the building or structure or portion
thereof is in violation of any ordinance, regulation or provision of this code. If the certificate is suspended, all
violations must be corrected before it may be reinstated. If the certificate is revoked, a permanent Certificate of
Occupancy will be required before the building or structure or portion thereof may be re-occupied. Failure to comply
may resulf in removal of utilities to the building or structure or portion thereof, fines or both,

AMENDMENTS TO THE STATE OF NEW MEXICO
TECHNICAL CODES

The following adopts and amends the technical provisions of the 2021 New Mexico Building Code. Each
amendment is numbered to correspond to the numbering of the 2021 International Building Code and the 2021
International Residential Code.

Allmention of L.P. gas shall be deleted from these Codes. Refertothe L.P. Gas Bureau of the State of New Mexico
for regulations.

NEW MEXICO COMMERCIAL BUILDING CODE
CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

Delete Chapter 1 of the New Mexico Commercial Building Code, except as provided below, and refer to Chapter 1 o
the Uniform Administrative Code of the City of Albuguerque. :

Section 101.1 is adopted as written.
Section 101.4 is adopted as written.
Section 102 is adopted as written.
Section 103 is adopted as written.

Section 104 is adopted as written.

[2024] [2023] City of Albugquerque Uniform Administrative Code B



Docusign Envelope 1D: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Section 106 is adopted as written,

CHAPTER 18
SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS

See Chapter 18 of the New Mexico Commercial Building Code with the following amendment;

1809.5 Frost protection. See this section of the International Building Code with the following changes: delete the
text of item 1, and replace with the following:

1. Extending a minimum of sixteen inches (16") below the adjacent finish grade.
CHAPTER 30
ELEVATORS, CONVEYING SYSTEMS, PLATFORM LIFTS, AND STAIRWAY CHAIRLIFTS

See Chapter 30 of the New Mexico Commercial Building Code with the following amendments:
3001.3 Referenced Standards. Add the following at the end of this section:

It shall be the building owner’s responsibility to have new construction of elevator and escalators completed by
a Qualified Elevator Installer and inspected by a Qualified Elevator Inspector (QEI), certified by NAESA, prior to final
acceptance, per ASME A17.1 Section 8.10. The building owner shall maintain a certificate of approval onsite and
available for inspection.
Section 3009 Existing Elevators and Escalators. Add the following section:

3009.1 General, Existing elevator and escalator installations shall comply with ASME A17.3. It shall be the
building owner's responsibility to have existing elevator and escalators inspected by a Qualified Elevator Inspector

(QEI), certified by NAESA, at least annually, per ASME A17.3. The building owner shall maintain a certificate of
approval onsite and available for inspection.

CHAPTER 35
REFERENCED STANDARDS

See Chapter 35 of the New Mexico Commercial Building Code with the following amendments:

Add the following reference: ASME A17.3 2020, Safety Code for Existing Elevators and Escalators.

Add the following reference; ASME A17.5 — B44.1 -2019, Standard for Elevator and Escalator Electrical
Equipment.

NEW MEXICO RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODE
CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

Delete Chapter 1 of the New Mexico Residential Code, except as provided below, and replace with Chapter 1 of
the Uniform Administrative Code of The City of Albuguerque.

R101.1 is adopted as written.
R101.2 is adopted as written,

Section R102.5 is deleted.

-31- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope |1D; B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF285344

Section R102.7 is deleted.

R104 is adopted as written.
CHAPTER 3
BUILDING PLANNING

Chapter 3 of the New Mexico Residential Building Code is adopted as written with the following additions:

R301.2: The criteria listed in Table R301.2, shall be used as the minimum requirements for prescriptive designs of
Climatic and Geographic Design criteria:

Table R301.2 Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria

Subject to Damage From

lce Shield
Seismic Frost Winter Under- Air Mean
Rainfali Design | Weathering Line Termite Design | Layment | Freezing | Annual

Category Depth Termp Required Index Temp

2" per Moderate
hour c Moderate 16" to 12°F 546

Heavy

*3 second gust

R

Elevation | Altitude Coincident indoor winter Indeor winter design | Qutdoor winter Heating temperatur
correction wet bulb design dry- dry-buib temperature | design dry-bulb difference

Factor buib temperature
temperature

Project
Site N/A 60°F 72°F 72°F 18°F 52°F
Location
Latitude Daily range | Indoor Summer Indoor summer Outdoor summer | Cooling temperature
summer design gains design dry-bulb design dry-bulb difference
design temperature femperature
relative
humidity
35°N 24°p 50%

R302.1.1 Zero Lot Line Separation. Delete this section of the New Mexico Residential Code.
2021 NEW MEXICO EARTHEN BUILDING MATERIALS CODE
Adopted as written.
2021 NEW MEXICO HISTORIC EARTHEN BUILDING CODE

Adopted as written.
2021 NEW MEXICO EXISTING BUILDING CODE

CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

Delete Chapter 1 except as provided below and see Chapter 1 of the Uniform Administrative Code of The City
of Albuguergue.

Section 101.1 is adopted as written.

~32- [2024] [2023] City of Albuguerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

Section 101.4 is adopted as written.
Section 102 is adopted as written.
Section 103 is adopted as written.

Section 104 adopted as written,

2021 NEW MEXICO PLUMBING CODE
CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

Delete Chapter 1 in its entirety and replace with Chapter 1 of the Uniform Administrative Code of The City of
Albuquerque.

The provisions of this Code shall apply to the erection, installation, alteration, repair, relocation, replacement,
addition to, use, or maintenance of all plumbing systems and drainage systems. Appendices A, B, C,D,E, F, I, K,
and L of the Plumbing Code shall be considered as part of this Code. The International Association of Plumbing &
Mechanical Officials Installation Standards shall be considered only as a guide, The International Association of
Plumbing & Mechanical Officials Directory of Research Recommendations shall be considered only as a guide.

CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS

Delete Chapter 2 in its entirety and replace with Chapter 1, Part 2 of the Uniform Adminisirative Code of the City of
Albuquerque and Chapter 2 of the Uniform Plumbing Code with the following addition:

218.0 Plumbing Systems. Add the following: also, shall inciude fire protection systems.

CHAPTER 3
GENERAL REGULATION

Delete Chapter 3 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code in its entirety. Chapter 3 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is
adopted as written with the following changes:

312.6 Freezing Protection. Add to the end of the section: All water piping installed in any space adjacent to,
above or below, a heated area subject to freezing shall be protected from freezing by the use of a minimum
insulation required by the current adopted edition of the New Mexico Energy Conservation Code covering the
water piping. When blown-in insulation is used or for existing residential applications with plumbing in
unconditioned space, a semi-rigid material shall be draped over the pipe and extending down to the top of the
ceiling with no house insulation installed in the space below the piping. Water piping shall not be installed in any
outside walls, floors or ceilings of unheated areas.

CHAPTER 4
PLUMBING FIXTURES AND FITTINGS

Delete Chapter 4 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code in its entirety. Chapter 4 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is
adopted as written with the following changes:

Section 412.1.1 Nonwater Urinals. Delete the text of this section and replace with the following: Nonwater urinals
shall be listed and comply with the applicable standards in Table 14-1 and manufacturer's specifications.
Nonwater urinals shall have a barrier liquid sealant to maintain a trap seal. Nonwater urinals shall be located on the
downstream side of a frequently used water-using fixture. Nonwater urinals shall permit the uninhibited flow of waste
through the urinal to the sanitary drainage system. Nonwater urinals shall be cleaned and maintained in
accordance with the manufacturer's instructions after installation. Where nonwater urinals are installed they shall
have a water distribution line rough-in to the urinal location to allow for the installation of an approved backflow
prevention device in the event of a retrofit.

-33- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Deocusign Envelope iD: B200091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Section 422.0 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures. Delete this section of the Uniform Plumbing Code.

Table 4221 Minimum Plumbing Facilities. Delete this table of the Uniform Plumbing Code. Reference
applicable section of the current adopted edition of the New Mexico Commerciat Building Code.

CHAPTER 5
WATER HEATERS

Delete Chapter 5 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code in its entirety. Chapter 5 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is
adopted as written with the following changes:

Section 504.3.2 Unlisted Water Heaters. Delete the text of this section and replace with the following: Unlisted
Water Heaters shall not be installed.

Section 507.13 installations in Residential Garages. Delete the following text: “unless listed as fiammable vapor
ignition resistant.”

510.2.20 Chimneys and vents. See this chapter of the UPC except delete the following language: “Where vents
extend outdoors above the roof more than 5 feet (1524mm) higher than required by Table 509.6.1, and where vents
terminate in accordance with Section 509.6.1(1)(b), the outdoor portion of the vent shall be enclosed as required by
this section for vents not considered to be exposed to the outdoors or such venting shall be engineered.”

CHAPTER 6
WATER SUPPLY AND DISTRIBUTION

Adopt Chapter 6 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code in its entirety and add the following:

606.5 Control Valve. Add to the end of the section: Installations of multipie water heaters connected to a common
manifold shall have separate isolation valves installed on the hot and cold-water lines within three (3) feet of each
water heater.
CHAPTER 7
SANITARY DRAINAGE
Part | Drainage Systems

Delete Chapter 7 Part | of the New Mexico Plumbing Code in its entirety. Chapter 7 Part 1 of the Uniform Plumbing
Code is adopted as written with the following changes:

704.3 Commercial Dishwashing Machines and Sinks. Delete the text of this section and replace with the
following: Pot sinks, scullery sinks, dish-washing sinks, silverware sinks, commercial dishwashing machines,
silverware washing machines, and other similar fixtures shall not be connected directly to the drainage system.
Such equipment or fixtures shall be drained by means of indirect waste pipes, as defined in Chapter 2 of the UPC,
and all wastes drained by them shall discharge through an airgap into an open floor sink or other approved type
receptor that is properly connected to the drainage system. Food waste disposal units shall be connected directly
to the drainage system. A floor drain shall be provided adjacent to the disposal unit, and the disposal unit shall be
connected on the sewer side of the floor drain trap, provided that no other drainage line is connected between the
floor drain waste connection and the disposal unit drain. The floor drain shall be trapped and vented as required in
this code.

707.10 Fittings. Add to the end of the section; Each cleanout shall be sized as per table 707.1 for the largest
diameter pipe of the run,

712.1 Media: See this section of the Uniform Plumbing Code except add the following text to the end of the
section: When testing during weather conditions that could result in damage o piping, adequate provisions shall
be made to protect such piping from freezing.

-34- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B280091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2ZAF2B5344 '

PART Il BUILDING SEWERS

715.1 Building Sewer Materials. Change to read as follows: The building sewer, beginning two (2) feet from any
building or structure, and not in a public right away shall be of such materials as may be approved by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction under the approved procedures set forth in Chapter 1 of this Code. Building sewers 4" and
smaller are required to be a minimum of schedule 40 piping. Building sewers 6" and larger are required to be a
minimum of SDR 35 (ASTM 3034) piping. Drainage fittings or approved manhales shall be used to connect building
sewers to utility lines on private property. All building sewers may be constructed of SDR 26 PVC {(ASTM 3034)

piping.

715.2 Joining Methods and Materials: A Sewer tap and Stub-in is from the sewer main connection to the private
property line. Approved materials for this use include hub and spigot, no hub cast iron and PVC schedule 40
meeting SDR 26 or ASTM 2665 or meeting ASTM 3034, All fittings shall be drainage type fittings. The minimum
size of such piping shall be 4" nominal diameter. If the Albuguerque Bernalilloc County Water Utility Authority
(ABCWUA) sewer main is fapped, either an approved saddle or a y-branch fitting must be used at the point of
connection between the house sewer and the main. Approval to "tap” the sewer is required from the ABCWUA,
The vertical section of service risers, if required, when connecting to flexible mains {(PVC SDR 35, etc.) shall be
schedule 40 PVC meeting ASTM D2665 or PVC SDR 26 meeting ASTM 3034, The Horizontal Section of all laterals
shall be of schedule 40 PVC, SDR28, schedule 40 cast iron or ASTM D2657 or ASTM D3261, ASTM D2683 heat
fusion Polyolefin pipe and fittings and use of trench less systems. ABS piping may not be used in the public right
of way.
CHAPTER 8
INDIRECT WASTES

See Chapter 8 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code.

CHAPTER 8
VENTS

See Chapter 9 of the New Mexico Flumbing Code,

CHAPTER 10
TRAPS AND INTERCEPTORS

See Chapter 10 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code, which adopts Chapter 10 of the Uniform Plumbing Code in its
entirety, with the following changes:

1002.3 Change of Direction, Add to the end of the section: An approved slip joint on the outlet side of a frap may
be substituted for a clean-out on trap arms 1-1/2" or smaller, provided the change of direction does not exceed 135
degrees.

1014.0 Grease Interceptors. Add to the end of the section: Grease interceptors installed above ground shall either:
1. Discharge through a minimum 1" air gap into an approved indirect waste receptor, or
2. Have a properly trapped and vented indirect waste on the inlet. If the indirect waste is on the inlet, the
drainage flow must be controlled in a manner so as to prevent overflow of the receptor.

1014.3.6.1 Grease interceptor sizing chart. Add to the end of the section: The minimum size of a grease trap
required for coffee, sandwich, ice cream, and similar non-cooking establishments shall be one with a forty (40)
pound capacity.

CHAPTER 11
STORM DRAINAGE

See Chapter 11 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code with the following addition:

1101.1 Applicability. Add to the end of the section: The rainfall rate for the City of Albugquerque shall be 2 inches
per hour.,

-35- [2024] [2023] City of Albugquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B280091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

CHAPTER 12
FUEL PIPING

See Chapter 12 of the New Mexico Plumbing Code with the following changes:

Section 1210.9.3 Emergency shutoff valves. Delete this section of the New Mexico Plumbing Code and see this section of
the Uniform Plumbing Code. Add to the end of the section: For the purpose of isolation and safety, an additional full-
bore gas shutoff shall be installed downstream of the serving supplier gas meter prior to any distribution of gas into
the gas piping system. This includes all new and re-pipe systems.

Section 1213.3 Test Pressure: Delete this section of t3he New Mexico Plumbing Code and see this section of the
Uniform Plumbing Code.

NEW MEXICO SWIMMING POOL, SPA AND HOT TUB CODE
CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

Delete Chapter 1 in its entirety and replace with Chapter 1 of the Uniform Administrative Code of The City of
Albuquerque and add Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the erection, installation, alterations, repair,
relocation, replacement, addition to, use, and maintenance of swimming pools, spas, or hot tubs within its
jurisdiction.
CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS

Delete Chapter 2 of the New Mexico Swimming Pool, Spa, and Hot Tub Code in its entirety, Chapter 2 of the
Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa, and Hot Tub Code is adopted as written.

NEW MEXICC MECHANICAL CODE
CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

Delete Chapter 1 in its entirety and replace with Chapter 1 of the Uniform Administrative Code of The City of
Albuquerque and add Scope: The provisions of this Code shall apply to the erection, installation, alteration, repair,
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of all mechanical systems. Appendixes A, B, C, and F of
the Uniform Mechanical Code shall be considered as part of this Code. Refer all references to LPG o the LP Gas
Bureaus,

CHAPTER 2

DEFINITIONS

See Chapter 2 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code as written.

CHAPTER 3
GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

See Chapter 3 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code in its entirety.

CHAPTER 4
VENTILATION AIR SUPPLY

See Chapter 4 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code.

-36- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code B



Docusign Envelope ID: B290081A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

CHAPTER S
EXHAUST SYSTEMS

See Chapler 5 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code with the following changes:
508.1 Hoods Where Required. Add to the end of the section: A food-processing establishment shall also include
any building or portion thereof used for the processing of food, including churches, day care centers and similar

occupancies, but shall not include a dwelling unit.

EXCEPTION: A low temperature dishwashing machine with a maximum water temperature setting of
140°F or {ess will not be required to be provided with a type Il heod.

CHAPTER 6
DUCT SYSTEMS

See Chapter 6 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code.

CHAPTER 7
COMBUSTION AIR

See Chapter 7 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code, which adopts Chapter 7 of the Uniform Mechanical Code.

CHAPTER 8
VENTS

See Chapter 8 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code, which adopts Chapter 8 of the Uniform Mechanical Code.

CHAPTER 9
SPECIFIC EQUIPMENT

See Chapter 9 of the Uniform Mechanical Cede with the following changes.

904.2.2 Clearances. Delete this section and replace with “Unlisted central-heating furnaces and boilers shall not be
installed.”

906.1.2 Installation: Deleted this section and replace with “Unlisted floor furnaces shall not be installed.”
907.1.1 installation: Delete this section and replace with “Unlisted wail furnaces shall not be installed”

CHAPTER 10
STEAM AND HOT WATER BOILERS

See Chapter 10 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code, which adopts Chapter 10 of the Uniform Mechanical Code in
its entirety, with the following changes:

1001.1 Appiicability: Add to the end of the section: All commercial boilers, except sectional boilers, exceeding
200,000 BTY input must be ASME constructed and National Board registered. Sectional boilers shall be ASME
constructed but are not required to be issued a National Board number. All commercial boilers less than 200,000
BTU input must be listed and approved.

1001.1 Exceptions: Add exception (9): Boilers installed in one- and two-family dwellings as defined by the currently
adopted residential code.

[2024] [2023] City of Albuguerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope |D: B290091A-B6E9-4F82-BAB1-11AZAF2B5344

1002.1: Standards: Add to the end of the section: All commercial boilers, and potable water heaters in excess of
200,000 BTU input, shall be installed and inspected.

1003.1 Safety Requirements. All boilers and fired pressure vessels installation and the repair thereof shall
conform to minimum requirements for safety from structural and mechanical faflure and excessive pressures
astablished by the Building Official in accordance with the currently adopted ASME Boiler and Pressure Vessel
Code, Section |, and [V with the amendments and interpretations thereto made and approved by the Council of the
Society. Automatically fired boilers shall have the controls and safety devices as specified by the currently adopted
ASME CS8D-1, titled Controls and Safety Devices for Automatically Fired Boilers, and premulgated by the American
Society of Mechanical Engineers. Amendments and interpretations to the Code also may be adopted immediately
upon being promulgated, to the end that the definitions, rules and regulations shall at all times follow the generally
accepted nation-wide engineering standards. installations of multiple boilers manifold together requires each beiler
to have separate isolation valves installed between each boiler and the system within five (5) feet of boiler.

CHAPTER 11
REFRIGERATION

See Chapter 11 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code which adopis Chapter 11 of the Uniform Mechanical Code.

CHAPTER 12
HYDRONICS

See Chapter 12 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code.

CHAPTER 13
FUEL PIPING

Chapter 13 of the New Mexico Mechanical Code and see Chapter 13 of the Uniform Mechanical Code with the
following changes:

Section 1310.11.2 Emergency Shutoff Valves. For the purpose of isolation and safety, an additional fuil-bore gas
shutoff shall be installed downstream of the serving supplier gas meter prior to any distribution of gas into the gas
piping system. This inciudes all new and re-pipe systems.

NEW MEXICO ELECTRICAL CODE
CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

Delete Sections 14.10.4.1 through 14.10.4.9 and substitute Chapter 1 of the Uniform Administrative Code of the City
of Albuquerque.

Article 215. Feeders.

Section 215.1. Scope. See this section of the [2047} [2020] NMEC and add: For townhouse construction, feeders
may not run through, over or below any other dwelling unit or the property associated with another dwelling.

Article 240 Overcurrent Protection.

240.24(E} Not Located in Bathrooms. Delefe this section and replace with: Overcurrent devices, other than
supplementary overcurrent protection, shail not be located in bathrooms.

2021 NEW MEXICO COMMERCIAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

Adopted as written with the following changes: Delete Chapter 1 except as provided below and replace with Chapter
1 of the Uniferm Administrative Code of the City of Albuquerque.

-38- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code



Docusign Envelope ID: B290091A-86E9-4F82-BAB1-11A2AF2B5344

Section C101.1 Adopted as written.
Section C108 Adopted as written.
2021 NEW MEXICO RESIDENTIAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

Adopted as written with the following changes: Delete Chapter 1 except as provided below and replace with Chapter 1
of the Uniform Administrative Code of the City of Albuquerque.

Section R101.1 Adopted as written,
Section R101.5.1 Adopted as written.
Section R108 Adopted as written.
NEW MEXICO SOLAR ENERGY CODE
CHAPTER1
ADMINISTRATION

Adopted as written with the following changes: Delete Chapter 1 except as provided below and replace with Chapter
1 of the Uniform Administrative Code of The City of Albuquerque.

Section 101.1 is adopted as written.

Section 102.1 is adopted as written,

-30- [2024] [2023] City of Albuquerque Uniform Administrative Code





